
DEPARTMENT MATERIAL UID DESCRIPTION MATERIAL REQUIREMENT 

ACT PIPE AND 

SUPPLY Core & Main

CPR Services & 

Supplies / dba 

MDN Enterprise Rural Pipe
WASTEWATER 221-2202-0100 32" MANHOLE AND LID A No Bid No Bid 242.11 315.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0200 CLEAN OUT BOOT A No Bid 56.48 42.11 95.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0300 CLEAN OUT BOOT LID A No Bid 10.59 8.42

Included 

w/above bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0400 10" ADAPTER RUBBER CLAY TO PVC A 18.50 22.86 17.49 22.85

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0500 10" WING NUT PLUG A No Bid 278.71 173.00 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0600 12" ADAPTER RUBBER PVC TO PVC A 21.55 26.67 20.63 26.68

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0700 12" ADAPTER RUBBER CLAY TO PVC A 21.55 26.67 20.63 26.68

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0800 12" X 2" PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST A No Bid No Bid 382.00 374.05

WASTEWATER 221-2202-0900 15" ADAPTER RUBBER CLAY TO PVC A 37.00 45.16 34.56 45.16

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1000 22-1/2" BEND PVC A 5.95 No Bid No Bid 7.05

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1100 4" ADAPTER RUBBER CLAY TO CI/PVC A 3.80 4.63 3.65 4.63

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1200 4" ADAPTER RUBBER PVC TO PVC A 3.88 4.63 3.65 4.63

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1300 4" ADAPTER SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 3.15 F4.27/M4.09

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1400 4" BEND PVC 45 SCH 40 A 3.88 9.15 7.22 9.15

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1500 4" BEND PVC 90 SCH 40 A 4.75 7.03 5.55 7.03

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1600 4" COUPLING PVC DWV A 2.65 3.86 3.04 3.85

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1700 4" FEMALE ADAPTER PVC DWV A 4.27 5.31 4.19 5.69

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1800 4" FLEXIBLE SEWER SADDLE TEE W/51" STAINLESS BANDS A 25.38 43.54 34.38 43.55

WASTEWATER 221-2202-1900 4" MALE PVC DQV PLUG A 2.50 2.52 3.01 2.70

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2000 4" TEE PVC SCH 40 DWV A 13.50 22.51 17.77 22.51

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2100 4" X 4" X 4" TEE PVC TWO WAY CLEANOUT SCH 40 DWV A 18.90 20.46 16.15 20.45

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2200 51" STAINLESS BAND WITH FLIP OUT SCREW A 4.00 4.54 3.58 4.85

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2300 6" ADAPTER RUBBER PVC TO PVC A 8.00 9.90 7.81 9.89

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2400 6" ADAPTER RUBBER CLAY TO PVC A 8.00 9.90 7.81 9.89

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2500 6" BEND PVC 90 SDR 35 A 11.95 10.55 8.33 10.55

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2600 6" WING NUT PLUG A No Bid No Bid 37.00 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2700 6" WING NUT PLUG A No Bid No Bid 37.00 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2800 6" X 2" PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST A No Bid No Bid 165.00 157.12

WASTEWATER 221-2202-2900 6" X 22-1/2" BEND PVC SDR 35 A 10.15 13.88 10.96 13.88

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3000 6" X 4" TEE PVCSDR 35 A 17.50 15.48 12.22 15.48

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3100 6" X 4" WYE PVC SDR35 A 18.05 19.48 15.38 19.48

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3200 6" X 45 BEND GASKEY PVC SDR35 A 10.45 16.07 12.68 16.70

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3300 6" X 6" X 6" TEE PVC SDR 35 A 17.90 15.82 12.48 15.84

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3400 8" ADAPTER RUBBER CLAY TO PVC A 13.35 15.23 12.02 15.23

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3500 8" ADAPTER RUBBER PVC TO PVC A 12.40 15.23 12.02 35.47

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3600 8" BEND PVC 45 SDR35 A 29.25 31.02 24.48 34.55

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3700 8" TEE GASKET PVC SDR35 A 39.65 64.55 50.96 64.55

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3800 8" X 2" PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST A No Bid No Bid 208.00 201.56

WASTEWATER 221-2202-3900 8" X 22-1/2 BEND PVC SDR35 A 29.50 35.98 28.33 35.88

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4000 8" X 4" TEE GASKTE PVC SDR35 A 27.00 70.56 27.33 34.61

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4100 8" X 6" WYE SDR 35 A 32.05 49.99 39.46 49.99

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4200 10" PVC GASKETED GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034)14 A 105.70 No Bid 5.40 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4300 12" PVC GASKETED GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034)14 A 151.90 No Bid 7.75 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4400 14" PVC SEWER PIPE DR-25 A No Bid No Bid 15.25 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4500 15" PVC GASKETED GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034)14 A No Bid No Bid 11.53 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4600 2" X 26" CONCRETE ADJUSTMENT RING A No Bid No Bid 8.42 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4700 23-1/2" MANHOLE LID A No Bid 88.24 97.89 85.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4800 23-1/2" MANHOLE RING A No Bid 87.06 80.54 65.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-4900 23-1/2" MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RISER RING A No Bid No Bid 36.84 106.25

WASTEWATER 221-2202--5000 24" MANHOLE LID A No Bid 100.00 137.38 145.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5100 24" MANHOLE RING A No Bid 92.95 90.68 106.25

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5200 24" MANHOLE RING A No Bid No Bid 90.68 106.25

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5300 4' MANHOLE FIBERGLASS A No Bid No Bid 939.13 1085.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5400 6' MANHOLE FIBERGLASS A No Bid No Bid 1216.30 1320.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5500 6" PVC GASKETED GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034)14 A 37.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5600 8' MANHOLE FIBERGLASS A No Bid No Bid 1492.39 1495.00

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5700 8" PVC GASKETED GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034)14 A 67.34 No Bid 3.44 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-5800 REVERSIBLE RING A No Bid No Bid 159.05 No Bid



WASTEWATER 221-2202-5900 STORM COVER A No Bid No Bid 130.53 No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-6000 ROOT BE GONE A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

WASTEWATER 221-2202-6100 STOP LEAK HYD CEMENT A No Bid 30.13 28.89 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-0020 3/4" x 100' TUBING ENDOTRACE A No Bid 0.98 0.71 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-0040 1" X 100' TUBING ENDOTRACE A No Bid 1.13 0.82 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-0060 3" FLANGE A 14.00 24.18 17.46 26.30

WATER 220-2202-0080 4" ELL BEND 90 MJ A 37.65 40.71 36.47 43.31

WATER 220-2202-0100 4" GATE VALVE MJ LESS/ACC A 333.30 433.84 345.14 415.02

WATER 220-2202-0120 4" SOLID SLEEVE A 33.45 36.18 32.42 38.50

WATER 220-2202-0140 4" X 13" ANCHOR COUPLING FULL BODY A 57.05 61.67 53.57 65.01

WATER 220-2202-0160 6" BEND 11-1/4 CI A 47.55 51.39 45.10 54.69

WATER 220-2202-1800 6" BEND 22-1/2 A 45.65 49.34 43.30 52.50

WATER 220-2202-0200 6" BEND 45 CI A 50.20 54.27 48.63 57.75

WATER 220-2202-0220 6" BEND 90 CI A 61.60 66.60 59.68 70.88

WATER 220-2202-0240 6" GATE VALVE MJ DI LESS/ACC A 435.00 553.91 440.63 495.25

WATER 220-2202-0260 6" MEGALUG RETAINER GLAN PIP DI A No Bid 33.96 19.43 24.61

WATER 220-2202-0280 6" TAPPING VALVE A 647.45 772.31 614.53 472.50

WATER 220-2202-0300 6" X 12" GRADELOCK FIRE HYDRANT A No Bid 299.07 339.86 417.04

WATER 220-2202-0320 6" X 12-1/2" SOLID SLEEVE MJ A 55.90 60.44 54.16 64.31

WATER 220-2202-0340 6" X 13" ANCHOR COUPLING COMPACT A 101.15 109.36 95.00 116.38

WATER 220-2202-0360 6" X 24" ANCHOR COUPLING COMPACT A 150.65 153.75 141.43 173.25

WATER 220-2202-0380 6" X 24" GRADELOCK FIRE HYDRANT A No Bid 381.06 433.20 531.39

WATER 220-2202-0400 6" X 6" GRADELOCK FIRE HYDRANT A No Bid 179.60 190.83 236.64

WATER 220-2202-0420 6" X 6" X 6" TEE ANCHOR MJ LESS/ACC DOMES A 102.35 110.59 178.24 218.35

WATER 220-2202-0440 6" X 6" X 6" TEE MJ A 89.00 96.20 84.43 102.38

WATER 220-2202-0460 6" X 7-1/2" SOLID SLEEVE CI A 51.45 No Bid 39.69 48.13

WATER 220-2202-0480 8" BEND 22-1/2 CI A 71.10 76.88 67.47 81.81

WATER 220-2202-0500 8" ANCHOR COUPLING SPLIT RING A No Bid 30.02 35.40 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-0520 8" BEND 11-1/4 MJ A 64.65 69.89 61.34 74.38

WATER 220-2202-0540 8" BEND 45 MJ CI A 73.00 78.94 69.28 84.00

WATER 220-2202-0560 8" BEND 90 MJ LESS/ACC A 89.40 96.62 84.79 109.67

WATER 220-2202-0580 8" GATE VALVE MJ DI LESS/ACC A 685.00 755.58 701.18 800.11

WATER 220-2202-0600 8" MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAN PIPE DI A No Bid 46.28 29.21 34.69

WATER 220-2202-0620 8" TAPPING VALVE A 913.00 977.09 912.80 587.50

WATER 220-2202-0640 8" X 12" SOLID SLEEVE CI A 90.55 97.85 85.88 104.13

WATER 220-2202-0660 8" X 13" ANCHOR COUPLING COMPACT A 129.35 139.78 121.43 148.75

WATER 220-2202-0680 8" X 7-1/2" SOLID SLEEVE A 90.55 58.79 51.60 62.56

WATER 220-2202-0700 8" X 8" X 6: TEE ANCHOR MJ A 128.20 138.55 120.36 147.44

WATER 220-2202-0720 8" X 8" X 6" TEE MJ A 110.30 119.23 104.64 126.88

WATER 220-2202-0740 8" X 8" X 8" TEE MJ A 133.15 143.89 126.29 153.13

WATER 220-2202-0760 10" BEND 45 CI A 105.75 114.29 99.29 121.63

WATER 220-2202-0780 10" GATE VALVE MH LESS/ACC A 1068.00 1374..15 1093.18 1245.23

WATER 220-2202-0800 10" X 12" SOLID SLEEVE CI A 108.05 116.76 101.43 124.25

WATER 220-2202-0820 10" X 2" CAP MJ A 66.20 71.54 62.14 76.13

WATER 220-2202-0840 10" X 2" PLUG MJ A 100.45 108.54 94.29 115.50

WATER 220-2202-0860 12" BEND 11-1/4 MJ A 129.00 139.78 122.68 148.75

WATER 220-2202-0880 12" BEND 22-1/2 MJ A 138.00 149.24 130.98 158.81

WATER 220-2202-0900 12" BEND 45 MJ A 157.85 170.62 149.74 181.56

WATER 220-2202-0920 12" BEND 90 MJ A 190.95 206.3.8 181.13 219.63

WATER 220-2202-0940 12" FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION A No Bid 188.12 455.16 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-0960 12" GATE VALVE MH LESS/ACC A 1350.00 1659.75 1383.20 1606.25

WATER 220-2202-0980 12" MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAN PIPE DI A No Bid 88.45 63.07 74.90

WATER 220-2202-1000 12" SOLID SLEEVE SHORT MJ CI A 110.30 119.23 104.64 126.88

WATER 220-2202-1020 12" X 12" SOLID SLEEVE CI A 145.65 157.46 138.20 167.56

WATER 220-2202-1040 12" X 12" X 12" TEE MJ LESS/ACC A 260.00 286.96 251.86 305.38

WATER 220-2202-1060 12" X 12" X 6" TEE ANCHOR MJ A 182.50 199.39 175.00 212.19

WATER 220-2202-1080 12" X 12" X 8" TEE MJ LESS/ACC A 205.00 224.06 196.65 238.44

WATER 220-2202-1100 12" X 2" CAP PLUG MJ A 92.05 108.90 87.32 105.88

WATER 220-2202-1120 12" X 6" TEE MJ A 179.90 194.46 170.67 194.76

WATER 220-2202-1140 14" MEGA LUG PVC C905 A 142.00 153.69 114.42 140.16

WATER 220-2202-1160 14" X 7-1/2" SOLID SLEEVE C150 FOR DI A No Bid 224.06 194.64 238.44

WATER 220-2202-1180 16" VALVE BOX TOP A 19.40 No Bid 20.65 No Bid



WATER 220-2202-1200 18" X 24" VALVE BOX W/LID A 35.00 28.24 26.09 30.00

WATER 220-2202-1220 24" X 36" VALVE BOX W/LID A 38.00 65.89 35.87 41.25

WATER 220-2202-1240 36" X 48" VALVE BOX W/LID A No Bid 81.19 50.00 57.50

WATER 220-2202-1260 36" X 60" VALVE BOX W/LID A No Bid No Bid 77.42 89.04

WATER 220-2202-1280 METER BOX LARGE CONCRETE W/READER LID A 88.00 81.65 89.56 105.00

WATER 220-2202-1300 METER BOX LARGE PVC D1500 W/METER LID A No Bid 46.82 28.13 45.00

WATER 220-2202-1320 METER BOX LID SMALL PVC FITS D1200 BOX W/READER LID A No Bid 9.02 6.54 12.00

WATER 220-2202-1340 METER BOX SMALL PVC D1200 W/METER READER LID A No Bid 17.12 15.14 25.95

WATER 220-2202-1360 4" BOLT AND GASKET MJ LESS GLAND A 8.00 14.80 9.89 11.38

WATER 220-2202-1380 4" GLAN PAC MJ trasition A 9.75 15.68 13.70 15.75

WATER 220-2202-1400 4" GLAN PACK MJ A 9.50 11.32 12.93 14.88

WATER 220-2202-1420 4" MEGA LUG RETAINER GLAN PIP C909 A 16.15 33.04 20.04 23.76

WATER 220-2202-1440 6" BOLT AND GASKET MJ LESS GLAND A 11.30 20.46 11.41 13.13

WATER 220-2202-1460 6" GLAN PAC A 12.25 13.06 17.88 20.56

WATER 220-2202-1480 6" MEGA LUG PIPE C909 A 18.95 41.37 24.32 28.89

WATER 220-2202-1500 8" BOLT AND GASKET MJ LESS GLAND A 12.80 14.80 12.93 14.88

WATER 220-2202-1520 8" GLAN PAC A No Bid 22.64 19.78 22.75

WATER 220-2202-1540 8" MEGA LUG PIPE C909 A 36.70 55.79 35.91 42.70

WATER 220-2202-1560 10" GLAN PAC A 19.35 32.65 28.53 32.81

WATER 220-2202-1580 10" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK LESS GLAND A 16.90 19.59 17.12 19.69

WATER 220-2202-1600 12" GLAN PAC A 20.00 33.96 29.67 34.13

WATER 220-2202-1620 12" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK LESS GLAND A 17.65 20.46 17.88 20.56

WATER 220-2202-1640 12" MEGA LUG PVC C900 A 73.05 101.89 71.57 84.99

WATER 220-2202-1660 14" GLAN PAC MJ & DI C150 A 34.75 No Bid 42.50 52.06

WATER 220-2202-1680 1/2" FLEXIBLE COUPLING A No Bid No Bid 10.00 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-1700 3/4" AIR RELEASE A No Bid 85.00 183.07 175.00

WATER 220-2202-1720 3/4" STEEL COUPLING PIPE OD 1.05 LENGTH 4-1/2" TO 5" A 22.70 24.73 13.42 1.05

WATER 220-2202-1740 3/4" X 4" T-HEAD BOLT A 1.30 1.44 1.36 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-1760 1" STEEL COUPLING PIPE OD 1.32 LENGTH 4-1/2" TO 5" A 23.45 25.59 13.89 1.29

WATER 220-2202-1780 1-1/2" STEEL COUPLING PIPE OD 1.90 LENGTH 5 A 29.36 31.99 17.44 1.59

WATER 220-2202-1800 2" AIR RELEASE A No Bid 317.65 294.05 519.00

WATER 220-2202-1820 2" STEEL COUPLING PIPE OD 2.38 LENGTH 5 A 33.25 36.25 26.63 3.25

WATER 220-2202-1840 4" HYMAX COUPLING A 145.00 162.03 146.56 212.50

WATER 220-2202-1860 6" GASKET FLANGE A 2.85 2.28 2.31 8.00

WATER 220-2202-1880 6" GASKET TAPPING A No Bid No Bid 2.31 8.00

WATER 220-2202-1900 6" HYMAC COUPLING A 193.95 214.58 193.94 262.16

WATER 220-2202-1920 6" TAPPING SLEEVE OD 6.60 - 7.00 A 644.50 600.89 385.27 501.25

WATER 220-2202-1940 6" X 15" CLAMP OD 7.05-7.46 A 130.85 138.96 140.84 155.41

WATER 220-2202-1960 6" X 7-1/2" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 7.05 - 7.46 A 70.55 101.79 182.43 113.83

WATER 220-2202-1980 8" GASKET FLANGE A 3.80 2.44 3.30 10.00

WATER 220-2202-2000 8" GASKET TAPPING A No Bid No Bid 3.30 10.00

WATER 220-2202-2020 8" HYMAX COUPLING A 218.95 242.26 219.12 401.02

WATER 220-2202-2040 8" X 7-1/2" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 8.62-9.42 A 96.50 112.72 106.20 126.08

WATER 220-2202-2060 8" X 7-1/2" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 8.99-9.79 A 108.40 115.12 106.20 128.76

WATER 220-2202-2080 10" X 10" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 10.75 - 11.55 A 179.20 190.28 175.64 212.81

WATER 220-2202-2100 10" X 10" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 11.60 - 12.40 A 191.76 203.60 187.80 227.71

WATER 220-2202-2120 10" X 10" CLAMP OD 11.04 - 12.24 A 137.20 No Bid 178.45 225.38

WATER 220-2202-2140 10" X 10" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND AC ONLY A No Bid No Bid 178.45 318.55

WATER 220-2202-2160 10" X 15" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 10.75 - 11.55 A 268.20 284.82 263.05 338.88

WATER 220-2202-2180 10" X 15" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 11.60 - 12.40 A 285.35 302.99 279.48 356.90

WATER 220-2202-2200 12" X 15" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 12.75-13.55 A 300.50 319.11 294.35 404.55

WATER 220-2202-2220 12" GASKET FLANGE A 7.30 4.64 6.73 12.00

WATER 220-2202-2240 12" HYMAX COUPLING A 405.70 448.90 405.69 512.67

WATER 220-2202-2260 12" X 10" CLAMP OD 13.14 - 14.34 A No Bid 235.35 198.98 241.26

WATER 220-2202-2280 12" X 10" CLAMP OD 13.65 - 14.85 A No Bid 218.15 201.23 243.99

WATER 220-2202-2300 12" X 10" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 12.75 - 13.55 A 200.90 213.31 196.76 238.58

WATER 220-2202-2320 12" X 15" CLAMP DOUBLE BAND OD 13.14 - 14.34 A No Bid 349.65 295.12 357.84

WATER 220-2202-2340 12" X 15" CLAMP OD 13.65 - 14.45 A 305.90 355.00 299.60 363.26

WATER 220-2202-2360 14" CLAMP BELL JOINT REPAIR DI C150 A No Bid 885.10 807.95 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-2380 14" X 15" CLAMP OD 15.07 - 15.82 A 1065.00 476.52 439.58 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-2400 32 OZ CEMENT PVC HEAVY DUTY FAST SET A 11.41 20.59 16.48 21.20

WATER 220-2202-2420 32 OZ PRIMER PURPLE CAN A 5.75 16.55 11.68 9.21



WATER 220-2202-2440 FIRE HYDRANT WRENCH ADJUST A No Bid 21.19 19.54 25.00

WATER 220-2202-2460 GAUGE 0-300 LBS LIQUID FILLED #UG-GF TEXAS GAUGE A No Bid 36.87 13.56 14.99

WATER 220-2202-2480 GLUE JM BLUE OR HOT A No Bid No Bid 16.48 21.20

WATER 220-2202-2500 LUBRICANT PIPE A 4.40 3.82 9.73 8.00

WATER 220-2202-2520 PROBE ROD TIPS A No Bid 4.67 5.38 9.95

WATER 220-2202-2540 RECTOR SEAL TEFLOON A No Bid 16.45 26.34 2.85

WATER 220-2202-2620 1/2" X 3" CLAMP A 19.40 5.96 19.00 23.10

WATER 220-2202-2640 1/2" X 6" CLAMO A 41.32 10.99 40.47 49.08

WATER 220-2202-2660 3/4" X 3" CLAMP A 19.65 6.08 19.25 23.34

WATER 220-2202-2680 3/4" X 6" CLAMP A 41.55 11.32 40.69 49.34

WATER 220-2202-2700 3/4" X 7" CLAMP OD 3.73 - 4.00 A No Bid No Bid 73.24 63.01

WATER 220-2202-2720 1" X 3" CLAMP A 20.80 6.63 20.30 29.07

WATER 220-2202-2740 1" X 6" CLAMP A 41.85 12.05 41.03 49.70

WATER 220-2202-2760 1-1/2" X 6" CLAMP A 43.15 13.79 21.44 51.29

WATER 220-2202-2780 1-1/2" X 3" CLAMP A 21.90 7.32 42.30 26.00

WATER 220-2202-2800 2" X 3" CLAMP A 23.85 8.00 23.36 28.24

WATER 220-2202-2820 2" X 6" CLAMP A 44.30 14.49 43.40 52.61

WATER 220-2202-2840 2" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 2.35 - 2.63 A 43.60 46.46 42.70 51.78

WATER 220-2202-2860 2" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 2.35 - 2.63 COLLAR LEAK A 49.80 52.88 48.77 59.14

WATER 220-2202-2880 2" X 3/4" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 20.51 17.25 26.59

WATER 220-2202-2900 2" X 1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 20.51 17.26 26.59

WATER 220-2202-2920 3" X 3" CLAMP A 10.45 10.49 19.55 11.72

WATER 220-2202-2940 3" X 6" CLAMP A 20.00 21.19 32.14 23.70

WATER 220-2202-2960 3" X 7" CLAMP SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 73.24 61.53

WATER 220-2202-2980 3" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 3.46 - 3.70 A 51.80 55.00 73.24 61.53

WATER 220-2202-3000 3" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 3.49 - 4.29 A No Bid 58.36 73.24 88.80

WATER 220-2202-3020 3" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 3.96 - 4.25 A 55.00 58.36 73.24 65.28

WATER 220-2202-3040 3" X 15" CLAMP OD 3.49 - 4.29 A No Bid 105.68 143.84 121.75

WATER 220-2202-3060 3" X 3/4" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 24.42 22.76 32.26

WATER 220-2202-3080 3" X 1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 24.42 22.76 32.26

WATER 220-2202-3100 4" X 7" CLAMP COLLAR A 64.20 68.19 62.91 76.28

WATER 220-2202-3120 4" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 4.74 - 5.57 A 55.00 87.73 80.93 69.94

WATER 220-2202-3140 4" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 4.44 -- 5.24 A No Bid 85.69 79.04 95.83

WATER 220-2202-3160 4" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 4.45 - 4.73 A 56.90 60.42 79.04 67.58

WATER 220-2202-3180 4" X 15" CLAMP OD 4.44 - 5.24 A 142.00 169.66 156.56 138.26

WATER 220-2202-3200 4" X 15" CLAMP OD 4.74 - 5.57 A No Bid 174.53 160.99 138.26

WATER 220-2202-3220 4" X 3/4" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 27.71 74.39 34.59

WATER 220-2202-3240 4" X  1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 27.71 74.39 34.59

WATER 220-2202-3260 6" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 6.84 - 7.64 A No Bid 101.79 93.90 82.60

WATER 220-2202-3280 6" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 7.45 - 7.85 A 72.35 76.84 93.90 85.94

WATER 220-2202-3300 6" X 7-1/2" CLAMP OD 6.62 - 7.42 A No Bid 99.73 93.90 111.53

WATER 220-2202-3320 6" X 12" CLAMP OD 7.40 - 7.85 A No Bid 123.38 140.87 138.00

WATER 220-2202-3340 6" X 15" CLAMP OD 6.62 - 7.42 A No Bid 197.55 182.47 220.93

WATER 220-2202-3360 6" X 15" CLAMP OD 6.84 - 7..64 A No Bid 197.83 182.47 153.43

WATER 220-2202-3380 6" X 15" CLAMP OD 7.45-7.85 A 134.20 142.51 182.47 159.39

WATER 220-2202-3400 6" X 3/4" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 30.18 87.61 39.12

WATER 220-2202-3420 6" X 1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 30.18 87.61 39.12

WATER 220-2202-3440 6" X 2" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 43.73 110.05 50.05

WATER 220-2202-3460 8" X 15" CLAMP OD 8.62 - 9.42 A No Bid 222.98 207.48 182.99

WATER 220-2202-3480 8" X 15" CLAMP OD 8.99 - 9.79 A No Bid 224.95 207.48 188.41

WATER 220-2202-3500 8" X 3/4" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 38.73 108.43 47.29

WATER 220-2202-3520 8" X 1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 38.73 108.43 47.29

WATER 220-2202-3540 8" X 2" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 48.31 124.28 61.29

WATER 220-2202-3560 10" X 1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 54.95 134.34 64.89

WATER 220-2202-3580 12" X 3/4" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 60.04 157.21 64.89

WATER 220-2202-3600 12" X 1" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 60.04 157.21 64.89

WATER 220-2202-3620 12" X 2" TAP SADDLE A No Bid 76.38 180.51 97.15

WATER 220-2202-3640 1-1/2" ADAPTOR MALE SCH 40 A No Bid 0.54 0.41 0.80

WATER 220-2202-3660 1-1/2" BEND 45 SCH 40 A No Bid 0.96 0.74 1.10

WATER 220-2202-3680 1-1/2" COUPLING SCH 40 A No Bid 0.43 0.33 0.64

WATER 220-2202-3700 1-1/2" ELBOW 90 SCH 40 A No Bid 0.68 0.52 1.02

WATER 220-2202-3720 1-1/2" ADAPTOR FEMALE SCH 40 A No Bid 0.54 0.41 0.80



WATER 220-2202-3740 1-1/2" TEE SCH 40 A No Bid 0.91 0.69 1.10

WATER 220-2202-3760 2" GATE VALVE BRASS FEM X FEM A No Bid 26.26 25.26 29.43

WATER 220-2202-3780 2" VALVE BOX RISER A No Bid 9.38 8.42 21.00

WATER 220-2202-3800 1/2" METER COUPLING BRASS A No Bid No Bid 7.21 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-3820 1/2" X 7" METER RISER A No Bid No Bid 77.74 102.44

WATER 220-2202-3840 3/4" BALL CURB STOP PAD WING W/3/4" FLARE COPPER X 3/4" F A No Bid 67.00 32.73 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-3860 3/4" BEND 45 PVC A No Bid 0.47 0.37 0.65

WATER 220-2202-3880 3/4" CORPORATION A 42.30 32.65 27.40 84.46

WATER 220-2202-3900 3/4" COUPLING BRASS A No Bid 3.01 5.20 4.45

WATER 220-2202-3920 3/4" CURB STOP COPPER TO IRON A No Bid 37.76 53.95 36.97

WATER 220-2202-3940 3/4" CURB STOP IRON TO IRON A 73.75 33.68 46.03 56.90

WATER 220-2202-3960 3/4" ELL 90 PVC A No Bid 0.20 0.16 0.45

WATER 220-2202-3980 3/4" ADAPTOR FEMALE SCH 80 PVC FPT X SLIP A No Bid 2.34 1.80 2.50

WATER 220-2202-4000 3/4" GASKET WATER METER A No Bid 0.14 0.16 0.12

WATER 220-2202-4020 3/4" ADAPTOR MALE SCH 40 PVC MPT X SLIP A No Bid 0.56 0.15 0.30

WATER 220-2202-4040 3/4" SLIP COUPLING SCH 40 PVC A No Bid 0.50 0.13 0.26

WATER 220-2202-4060 3/4" TEE BRASS A No Bid 4.87 7.40 6.40

WATER 220-2202-4080 3/4" TEE PVC A No Bid 0.80 0.20 0.31

WATER 220-2202-4100 3/4" X 1/2" BUSHING BRASS A No Bid 2.13 4.78 2.95

WATER 220-2202-4120 3/4" X 4" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 3.56 2.96 4.49

WATER 220-2202-4140 3/4" X 6" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 4.85 4.38 6.28

WATER 220-2202-4160 3/4" ADAPTOR BRASS C81-33 3/4 COMP X 3/4 MIPT A 13.11 14.97 12.56 24.51

WATER 220-2202-4180 3/4" ANDLE STOP COMPRESSION A 34.81 44.35 34.51 45.91

WATER 220-2202-4200 3/4" COMPRESSION BEND BRASS 90 A 20.65 23.57 19.75 27.20

WATER 220-2202--4220 3/4" COMPRESSION COUPLING BRASS A 16.00 18.23 15.29 24.25

WATER 220-2202-4240 3/4" COMPRESSION COUPLING BRASS FEMALE A No Bid 15.75 13.21 24.51

WATER 220--2202-4260 3/4" ELL BRASS 90 FIP A No Bid 3.97 5.93 4.38

WATER 220-2202-4280 3/4" METER COUPLING STRAIGHT BRASS A No Bid 5.64 8.10 9.57

WATER 220-2202-4300 3/4" X 7" METER RISER A 78.53 89.63 80.80 109.22

WATER 220-2202-4320 3/4" X 9" METER RISER A 79.50 90.73 81.74 114.14

WATER 220-2202-4340 3/4" X 12" METER RSER A 82.30 93.92 84.41 123.29

WATER 220-2202-4360 3/4" X 15" METER RISER A 85.76 97.88 87.72 165.85

WATER 220-2202-4380 1" BEND 45 PVC A No Bid 0.56 0.44 0.82

WATER 220-2202-4400 1" CORPORATION A 55.65 49.38 40.44 88.05

WATER 220-2202-4420 1" COUPLING SCH 40 PVC A No Bid 0.89 0.22 0.42

WATER 220-2202-4440 1" CURB STOP COPPER TO IRON A No Bid 91.25 74.91 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-4460 1" CURB STOP IRON TO IRON A 112.15 81.96 69.94 72.51

WATER 220-2202-4480 1" ELL 90 PVC A No Bid 1.13 0.28 0.51

WATER 220-2202-4500 1" ADAPTOR FEMALE SCH 80 PVC A No Bid 3.44 2.72 3.43

WATER 220-2202-4520 1" ADAPTOR MALE PVC A No Bid 3.44 0.25 0.43

WATER 220-2202-4540 1" TEE PVC A No Bid 1.51 0.38 0.72

WATER 220-2202-4560 1" X 3/4" BUSHING TAPPER CC THREAD A No Bid 37.97 10.79 4.19

WATER 220-2202-4580 1" ADAPTOR BRASS MPT X COMP A 15.53 17.73 14.88 18.87

WATER 220-2202-4600 1" ADAPTOR FPT X COMP A No Bid 21.37 17.92 22.40

WATER 220-2202-4620 1" ADAPTOR ANGLE STOP COMPRESSION A 47.65 113.70 96.58 80.61

WATER 220-2202-4640 1" COMPRESSION COUPLING BRASS 90 A 26.50 30.26 25.41 34.98

WATER 220-2202-4660 1" COMPRESSION COUPLING BRASS A 18.26 16.78 17.49 27.31

WATER 220-2202-4680 1" COUPLING BRASS FIP A No Bid 4.86 8.69 6.50

WATER 220-2202-4700 1" ELL BRASS 90 A No Bid 6.10 9.44 6.56

WATER 220-2202-4720 1" METER COUPLING BRASS A No Bid 6.25 12.48 16.78

WATER 220-2202-4740 1" TEE BRASS A No Bid 8.63 13.35 10.40

WATER 220-2202-4760 1" U-BRANCH PIECE CTS PJ X TWO 3/4" MIP OUTLETS X 7-1/2 S A No Bid 39.75 34.54 145.17

WATER 220-2202-4780 1" X 10" METER RISER A 149.94 171.12 167.22 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-4800 1" X 12" METER RISER A 153.50 175.18 170.62 215.15

WATER 220-2202-4820 1" X 3/4" BUSHING BRASS A No Bid 3.20 5.43 4.15

WATER 220-2202-4840 1" X 4" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 4.81 4.27 7.10

WATER 220-2202-4860 1-1/2" X 6" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 12.46 11.08 13.86

WATER 220-2202-4880 1-1/2" BALL VALVE A 145.13 22.00 20.40 23.39

WATER 220-2202-4900 1-1/2" GASKET METER DROP IN A No Bid 1.18 1.96 1.75

WATER 220-2202-4920 1-1/2" GATE VALVE A No Bid 17.55 14.70 16.47

WATER 220-2202-4940 1-1/24" METER FLANGE A No Bid 59.75 34.63 101.83

WATER 220-2202-4960 1-1/2" X 1" BUSHING BRASS A No Bid 6.96 13.16 8.95



WATER 220-2202-4980 1-1/2" X 4" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 9.04 7.80 9.15

WATER 220-2202-5000 2" COUPLING SCH 40 PVC A No Bid 2.00 0.51 0.91

WATER 220-2202-5020 2" X 12" NIPPLE SCH 80 PVC A No Bid 6.25 4.75 6.02

WATER 220-2202-5040 2" BEND 45 PVC A No Bid 7.11 1.00 1.75

WATER 220-2202-5060 2" ELL 90 PVC SCH 80 A No Bid 7.14 2.61 3.31

WATER 220-2202-5080 2" ADAPTOR FEMALE SCH 80 PVC SLIP X FPT A No Bid 18.89 9.39 11.89

WATER 220-2202-5100 2" ADAPTOR MALE PVC SCH 80 A No Bid 14.42 7.17 9.08

WATER 220-2202-5120 2" TEE BRASS A No Bid 27.25 43.00 23.05

WATER 220-2202-5140 2" TEE PVC A No Bid 4.16 1.05 1.35

WATER 220-2202-5160 2" X 1-1/2" BUSHING BRASS A No Bid 10.32 16.23 9.20

WATER 220-2202-5180 2" X 4" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 10.85 9.65 11.79

WATER 220-2202-5200 2" X 6" NIPPLE BRASS A No Bid 17.15 14.15 14.81

WATER 220-2202-5220 5/8" X 2-1/2" STAINLESS STEEL BOLT AND NUT A No Bid No Bid 2.87 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5240 5/8" X 3-1/2" STAINLESS STEEL BOLT AND NUT A No Bid No Bid 3.41 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5260 2" ANGLE BALL METER VALVE FLANGE X PJ CTS A No Bid 332.97 280.56 367.85

WATER 220-2202-5280 2" BALL VALVE IRON TO IRON PIPE THREAD W/L A No Bid 271.23 203.79 256.90

WATER 220-2202-5300 2" BEND BRASS 90 IP A No Bid 19.68 31.12 19.20

WATER 220-2202-5320 2" COUPLING BRASS FIPT A No Bid 16.97 31.87 14.81

WATER 220-2202-5340 2" COUPLING PJ X PJ FOR COPPER CTS TO PVC A No Bid 112.06 94.02 88.41

WATER 220-2202-5360 2" ELL PJ CTS X PJ CTS BRASS 90 A No Bid 196.59 164.98 143.22

WATER 220-2202-5380 2" ADAPTOR FEMALE C14-77 2 PJ CTS X FIP BRASS A 64.81 73.97 62.06 85.28

WATER 220-2202-5400 2" GASKET FOR METER FLANGE DROP IN A No Bid 1.44 2.22 2.95

WATER 220-2202-5420 2" ADAPTOR MALE C84-772 PJ CTS X MIP BRASS A 62.00 78.95 59.37 78.98

WATER 220-2202-5440 2" METER FLANGE BRASS A No Bid 72.10 43.46 141.41

WATER 220-2202-5460 2" PLUG GALVANIZED CI CAPS OR PLUF A No Bid 2.45 4.06 3.25

WATER 220-2202-5480 1-1/2" PIPE BELL JOINT PVC SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 0.52 0.85

WATER 220-2202-5500 2" PIPE BELL JOINT PVC SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 0.57 1.00

WATER 220-2202-5560 1/2" PIPE PVC SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 0.27 0.25

WATER 220-2202-5580 3/4" PIPE PVC SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 0.27 0.32

WATER 220-2202-5600 1" PIPE PVC SCH 40 A No Bid No Bid 0.28 0.39

WATER 220-2202-5620 1-1/2" VALVE BOX RISER W/LID A No Bid No Bid 15.79 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5680 12" JOINT GASKET PIPE PVC C909 SDR18 A No Bid No Bid 15.63 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5720 14" X 15" SOLID SLEEVE MJ A 217.50 237.63 206.43 252.88

WATER 220-2202-5740 20" DUCTILE IRON PIPE CL50 A No Bid No Bid 59.91 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5760 20" X 15" SOLID SLEEVE MJ A 425.00 464.15 403.21 493.94

WATER 220-2202-5780 24" DUCTILE IRON PIPE A No Bid No Bid 75.66 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5800 24" MEGA LUG KIT DUCTILE A 324.00 371.03 321.81 394.21

WATER 220-2202-5820 24" X 15" SOLID SLEEVE MJ A 560.00 611.33 531.07 650.56

WATER 220-2202-5840 30" GLAN PACK C900 A 220.00 246.38 202.14 247.63

WATER 220-2202-5860 30" MEGA LUG PVC A 730.00 957.01 830.05 1016.81

WATER 220-2202-5880 30" MJ X MJ 22-1/2 BEND A 1211.00 1322.55 1148.93 1407.44

WATER 220-2202-5900 30" MJ X MJ 11-1/4 BEND A 1233.00 1346.39 1169.64 1432.81

WATER 220-2202-5920 30" MJPE X 30" BELL ADAPTER A No Bid No Bid 1437.86 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5940 30" PIPE PVC C905 DR25 A No Bid No Bid 72.35 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-5960 30" SOLID SLEEVE MH A 1172.00 1280.20 1112.14 1362.38

WATER 220-2202-5980 4" CAP BLIND A 13.95 15.22 13.63 37.63

WATER 220-2202-6000 4" PIPE BELL JOINT PVC SCH 40 A No Bid 113.56 1.80 2.15

WATER 220-2202-6020 5" VALVE BOX RISER A No Bid No Bid 14.74 17.50

WATER 220-2202-6040 6" DUCTILE IRON PIPE A No Bid No Bid 13.03 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6060 6" JOINT GASKET PVC C909 SDR18 A No Bid No Bid 4.26 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6080 6" X 2" CAP PLUG A No Bid 51.39 46.05 54.69

WATER 220-2202-6100 8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE A No Bid No Bid 17.28 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6120 8" JOINT GASKET PVC C909 SDR18 A No Bid No Bid 2.37 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6140 8" X 2" CAP PLUG A No Bid 69.18 61.89 73.50

WATER 220-2202-6160 4' FIRE HYDRANT A 1502.18 1995.78 1574.62 1756.00

WATER 220-2202-6180 5' FIRE HYDRANT A 1572.00 2088.48 1642.33 1837.00

WATER 220-2202-6200 6' FIRE HYDRANT A 1641.76 2181.18 1716.35 1880.00

WATER 220-2202-6220 METER BOX LID LARGE CONCRETE A No Bid 38.48 40.27 56.00

WATER 220-2202-6240 METER BOX LID LARGE METAL 2 PIECE A No Bid 97.78 89.56 165.00

WATER 220-2202-6260 METER BOX W/READER LID LARGE PVC LARGE A No Bid No Bid 29.04 40.25

WATER 220-2202-6280 METER BOX LID SMALL CONCRETE A No Bid 19.23 30.16 24.00

WATER 220-2202-6300 METER BOX SMALL CONCRETE A No Bid 22.53 23.11 42.25



WATER 220-2202-6320 METER BOX LID SMALL METAL W/READER A No Bid 25.75 67.71 45.00

WATER 220-2202-6340 2" JOINT HARD COPPER 20' A No Bid No Bid 157.40 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6360 3/4" X 60' TUBING COPPER ROLLS K-SOFT A 3.84 No Bid 204.60 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6380 3/4" X 100' TUBING COPPER ROLLS K-SOFT A 3.84 No Bid 341.00 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6400 1" X 60' TUBING COPPER ROLLS K-SOFT A 5.00 No Bid 266.40 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6420 1" X 100' TUBING COPPER ROLLS K-SOFT A 5.00 No Bid 444.00 No Bid

WATER 220-2202-6500 4' PROBE ROD A No Bid 48.59 21.52 45.65

WATER 220-2202-6520 5' PROBE ROD A No Bid 48.59 22.99 52.15

METER BOXES AND LIDS 0% 10% 8% 10%

POLY TUBING 0% 10% NO BID 10%

PVC FITTINGS 0% 20% 75% 10%

DUCTILE/CAST IRON FITTINGS 0% 20% 61% 10%

COUPLINGS, CLAMPS, AND SADDLES 0% 20% 55% 10%

GATE VALVES 0% 10% 65% 10%

FIRE HYDRANTS 0% 10% 55% 10%

CASTINGS 0% N/A NO BID 10%

MISCELLANEOUS-ALL OTHERS 0% N/A NO BID 10%

Throughout the contract the City of Huntsville may require additional items which are not specifically described above.  Those items may be purchased under this contract.  Responder shall quote percentage (%) discount to be offered to the City. Please quote your 

discount off the manufacturer's list price for the categories indicated below.  Any omissions from the additional items may be considered as a no bid for the additional items:

Items Not Specifically Listed on Bid


