
BID TABULATION

Bid # 08-10-22/23/24 Description: Avenue J 9th St. & University Sidewalk Time 2:00 PM Date:05/19/2009

Vendor Address Avenue J 9th St. University Ave Total

Absolute Ind. Huntsville, TX 133,318.25 29,650.00 93,152.75 256,121.00

AGC - ISQFT Houston, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

AMTEK Houston, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Craven Partners Hempstead, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Daughtie Construction Huntsville, TX 78,657.75 60,279.65 18,036.00 156,973.40

DL Meacham Houston, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Elliott Construction Bryan, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Encion Landscape Cleveland, TX 68,175.16 42,697.05 12,780.30 123,652.51

Grisham Construction Huntsville, TX 100,905.52 83,613.23 33402.81 217,921.56

J & M Construction Huntsville, TX 69,684.45 61,723.75 17,188.00 148,596.20

Lumbreras Foundation Pasadena, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mentri Concrete Houston, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pilgram Contractors Magnolia, TX 164,228.10

Santa Rosa Construction Vernon, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Southern Customs, Inc Houston, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Woodway Builders New Waverly, TX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




