BID TABULATION
Description:

Bid Number: 09-04 Fleet Vehicles Time: 1:00 PM Bids Received: Date:11/17/2008
Crown Vic per Central Building Capital Water
Vendor Name and Contact Each Inspections Maintenance Parks Construction Distribution
Jennings Anderson Ford
Option A 21,825.00 14,472.00 14,742.00|N/A N/A N/A
Option B N/A No Bid No Bid 18,226.00 18,470.00 26,844.00
OptionC __ __ _ __ . _ . ___.___INA___ | ____ 1352200 _ _ 13522.00(NA_ ___ __ NA L I 7N _
Sam Packs Five Star Ford
Option A 21,361.00 14,399.00 14,399.00|N/A N/A N/A
Option B N/A N/A N/A 16,661.00 19,249.00 26,432.00
OptionC __ __ . _____.___NA___ | ____ 187900 _ 13179.00(NA_ ___ ___ NA L N _
Caldwell Country Chevrolet
Option A No Bid 17,599.00 17,599.00|N/A N/A N/A
Option B 15,929.00 15,929.00 20,954.00 21,977.00 29,848.00
OptionC | _.___|_.__71m900 _ __ 17119.00NA _ . ANA I 1
Planet Ford
Option A Flex Fuel 20,587.00 14,425.00 14,176.00|N/A N/A N/A
Option B N/A 13,216.00 12,967.00 18,126.00 18,496.00 27,226.00
OptionC __ __ . _________INA___ | ____ 1887500 _ _. 13,126.00(N/A____ __ 7 _Iwa_ . _
Reliable Chevrolet
Option A No Bid 17,303.00 17,303.00 27,073.00 27,597.00 35,437.00
Option B 15,727.00 15,727.00 21,357.00 21,381.00 28,721.00
OptonC __ __ . _ . _ .. _._ | _._.___|._.__168300 _ __ 16823.000 _ _ __ . . I 1
HGAC
Option A 22,655.63 16,667.82 16,677.82|N/A N/A N/A
Option B N/A N/A 20,291.68 20,963.43 30,930.28
OptionC | _.___|_.__4s 15411.82INA ___ ANA . A 1
Tarrant County
Option A 22,281.20 16,342.05 16,342.05
Option B
optonc 15,076.05 15,076.05
Craig Chevrolet Late Bid




