Cold Water Meter- Displacement Type

ITEM # 1
Aqua Metric Aqua Metric
Badger Coburns Ferguson (#1) (#2) Hersey Meters ACT Pipe
Pri Pri
Size of Meter Price per Meter| Price per Meter| Price per Meter rice per rice per Price per Meter | Price per Meter
Meter Meter
5/8" x 3/4"
/8" x3/ S 36.25 | S 33.58 | $ 36.58 | S 34.35 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

5/8" x 3/4" with optional
electronic register S 122.72 | No Bid S 164.95 | S 98.51 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
1II

S 83.55|$ 101.14 | $ 86.12 | S 92.48 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" with optional electronic
register S 166.92 | No Bid S 216.27 | S 152.26 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" . . .

S 205.30 | $ 230.34 | $ 203.30 | $ 267.17 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" with optional electronic
register S 291.62 | No Bid S 329.84 | S 339.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
2II

S 29432 | $ 359.55 | $ 284.49 | S 393.91 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" with optional electronic
register S 383.55 | No Bid S 406.52 | S 473.76 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total S 1,584.23 | Incomplete S 1,72807 S 1,851.94 (S - S - S -

Cold Water Meter- Turbine Type (Class 1)
ITEM # 2
Aqua Metric Aqua Metric
Badger Coburns Ferguson (#1) (#2) Hersey Meters ACT Pipe
. . i . Price per Price per . .
Size of Meter Price per Meter| Price per Meter| Price per Meter Price per Meter | Price per Meter
Meter Meter

2" Turbine S 34840 | $ 280.90 | $ 364.60 | S 495.81 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Turbine with optional
electronic register S 456.56 | No Bid S 492.09 | S 603.44 | S 844.21 | No Bid No Bid
3" Turbine S 462.80 | S 42135 | S 574.42 (S 717.63 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




3" Turbine with optional

electronic register S 570.96 | No Bid S 681.36 | S 825.26 | S 1,051.99 | No Bid No Bid
4" Turbine S 650.00 | $ 561.80 | $ 836.30 (S  1,374.17 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Turbine with optional
electronic register S 758.16 | No Bid S 980.44 |S 1,481.80 | S 2,048.07 | No Bid No Bid
6" Turbine S 1,479.50 | S 842,70 | S 1,572.05 |$  3,104.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Turbine with optional
electronic register S 1,588.08 | No Bid S 1,742.15|$S 3,211.83 | S  3,687.20 | No Bid No Bid
8" Turbine S 1,943.76 | S 1,123.60 | S 2,084.73 |S  4,858.80 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" Turbine with optional
electronic regster S 2,051.92 | No Bid S 2,272.93 | S  4,966.43 | Available June | No Bid No Bid

One furnished | One furnished

N/C with N/C with

purchase of purchase of

100 meters 100 meters
Optional electronic meter TRPL combo of [TRPL combo of
reading device S 115.54 | No Bid any size any size No Bid No Bid
Total S 9,157.92 | Incomplete S 10,169.96 | S 19,822.49 | Incomplete S - S -

Cold Water Meter- Compound Type
ITEM #3
Aqua Metric Aqua Metric
Badger Coburns Ferguson (#1) (#2) Hersey Meters ACT Pipe
Pri Pri
Size of Meter Price per Meter| Price per Meter| Price per Meter rice per rice per Price per Meter | Price per Meter
Meter Meter

2" Compound S 1,011.09 | $ 92135 | $ 968.62 | $  1,242.92 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Compound with optional
electronic register S 1,218.88 | No Bid S 1,232.04 |$ 1,350.55 S  1,200.00 | No Bid No Bid
3" Compound S 1,019.20 | $ 1,235.96 | $ 1,288.50 | $  1,590.48 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
3" Compound with optional
electronic register S 1,250.08 | No Bid S 1,563.21 S 1,698.11 (S  1,520.00 | No Bid No Bid




4" Compound S 1,785.68 | $ 1,685.39 | $§ 1,764.23 | S  2,656.62 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Compound with optional
electronic register S 2,016.56 | No Bid S 2,055.73 | S 2,764.25|S  2,640.00 | No Bid No Bid
6" Compound S 2,504.32 | S 2,191.00 | S 3,21435|S  4,918.63 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Compound with optional
electronic register S 2,735.20 | No Bid S 3,557.03|S 5,026.26|S 4,560.00 | No Bid No Bid
8" Compound S 3,930.16 | $ 2,921.35 | S 9,280.30 | S  8,778.26 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" Compound with optional
electronic register S 4,161.04 | No Bid S 9,837.08 | S  8,885.89 | Available June | No Bid No Bid
One Furnished | One Furnished

Optional electronic meter n/c with n/c with
reading device purchase of purchase of

S 245.96 | No Bid No Bid 100 TRPL 100 TRPL No Bid No Bid
Total $ 18,629.00 | Incomplete S 31,27193 | $ 34,728.02 | Incomplete S - S

Strainers for Turbine and Compound Meters
ITEM #4
Aqua Metric Aqua Metric
Badger Coburns Ferguson (#1) (#2) Hersey Meters ACT pipe
. . i . Price per Price per . .
Size of Meter Price per Meter| Price per Meter| Price per Meter Price per Meter | Price per Meter
Meter Meter

2" Strainer, bolts, and gaskets
(bronze) S 185.00 | S 22472 | S 19253 | S 225.15 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
3' Strainer, bolts, and gaskets
(bronze) S 305.00 | S 337.08 | S 345.60 | S 282.10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Strainer, bolts, and gaskets
(bronze) S 375.00 | S 449.44 | S 540.08 | S 440.31 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Strainer, bolts, and gaskets
(bronze) S 595.00 | S 674.16 | S 772.08 | S 710.99 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" Strainer, bolts, and gaskets
(bronze) S 895.00 | S 898.88 | No Bid S  1,103.77 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total S 2,355.00 | $§ 2,584.28 | § 1,850.29 | S  2,762.32 | S - S - S

Cold Water Meter- Coumpound Series Type

ITEM #5




Aqua Metric Aqua Metric
Badger Coburns Ferguson (#1) (#2) Hersey Meters Act Pipe
. . i . Price per Price per . .
Size of Meter Price per Meter| Price per Meter| Price per Meter Price per Meter | Price per Meter
Meter Meter

2" Compound Series S 1,011.09 | $ 921.35 | Need specs S 1,242.92 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Compound Series with
optional electronice register S 1,218.88 | No Bid Need specs S 1,350.55 | S 1,200.00 | No Bid No Bid
3" Compound Series S 1,019.20 | $ 1,235.96 | Need specs S  1,590.48 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
3" Compound Series with
optional electronice register S 1,250.08 | No Bid Need specs S 1,698.11|S 1,520.00 | No Bid No Bid
4" Compound Series S 1,785.68 | $ 1,685.39 | Need specs S  2,656.62 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Compound Series with
optional electronic register S 2,016.56 | No Bid Need specs S 2,76425|S  2,640.00 | No Bid No Bid
6" Compound Series S 2,504.32 | S 2,191.00 | Need specs S  4,918.63 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Compound Series with
optional electronic register S 2,735.20 | No Bid Need specs S 5026.26|S 4,560.00 | No Bid No Bid
8" Compound Series S 3,930.16 | S 2,921.35 | Need specs S  8,778.26 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" Compound Series with
optional electronic register S 4,161.04 | No Bid Need specs S  8,885.89 | Available June | No Bid No Bid

One furnished | One furnished

N/C with N/C with

purchase of purchase of
Optional electronic meter 100 meters 100 meters
reading device S 245.96 | No Bid Need specs TRPL. Any size [TRPL. Any size | No Bid No Bid
Total S 18,629.00 | Incomplete S - S 34,728.02 | Incomplete S - S -

Mag Meter - Flanged
ITEM # 6
Aqua Metric Aqua Metric
Badger Coburns Ferguson (#1) (#2) Hersey Meters Act Pipe
Pri Pri
Size of Meter Price per Meter| Price per Meter| Price per Meter rice per rice per Price per Meter | Price per Meter
Meter Meter




Available Fall

10" Mag Meter w/ 50 ft. cord S 2,322.00 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid
Available Fall

10" Mag Meter w/ 75 ft. cord S 2,193.00 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid
Available Fall

10" Mag Meter w/ 100 ft. cord S 2,635.90 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid

10" Mag Meter w/ 50 Ft. cord, Available Fall

with Primo S 2,506.90 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid

10" Mag Meter w/ 75 ft. cord, Available Fall

with Primo S 2,769.20 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid

10" Mag Meter w/ 100 ft. cord, Available Fall

with Primo S 2,640.20 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid
Available Fall

Primo only S 807.50 No Bid Need Specs No Bid 2009 No Bid No Bid

Total $ 15,874.70 S - S - S S




