
BID TABULATION

Bid Number: 09-23 Description: Fuel

Time: 1:00

PM

Bids

Received: Date:04/01/2009

Vendor Contact Name and Phone # PST Freight State Tax Margin Total

Brenco Donald Broach 979-260-3819

unleaded 0.002 0.050 0.200 0.005 0.257

low diesel 0.002 0.055 0.200 0.005 0.262

dyed diesel 0.002 0.055 0.000 0.005 0.062

ethanol 0.002 0.050 0.200 0.005 0.257

WTG Fuels Scott Heller 281-851-9960

unleaded no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

low diesel 0.00219 0.150 0.200 0.050 0.40219

dyed diesel 0.00219 0.150 0.200 0.050 0.40219

ethanol 0.00219 0.150 0.200 0.050 0.40219

Gold Star J.J. Rodriguez 281-379-5928

unleaded 0.0019 0.0399 0.200 0.0314 0.2732

low diesel 0.0019 0.0731 0.2000 0.0320 0.3070

dyed diesel 0.0019 0.4296 0.000 0.0320 0.4635

ethanol 0.0019 0.0399 0.200 0.0314 0.2732

Petroleum Traders Corp.Gayle Netwon 800-348-3705 x 6347

unleaded 0.0010 0.0350 0.2000 0.0423 0.2783

low diesel 0.0010 0.0375 0.2000 0.0323 0.2708

dyed diesel 0.0010 0.2500 0.0000 0.1000 0.3510

ethanol 0.0010 0.0350 0.2000 0.0423 0.2783

John R. Hardy Inc. John R. Hardy 936-348-2616

unleaded 0.0020 0.0415 0.2000 0.1195 0.3630

low diesel 0.0020 0.0490 0.2000 0.1195 0.3705

dyed diesel 0.0020 0.0490 0.0000 0.1195 0.1705

ethanol no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Grisham Petroleum Kelton Grisham 936-295-3851

unleaded 0.0017 0.0500 0.2000 0.0495 0.3012

low diesel 0.0019 0.0500 0.2000 0.0495 0.3014

dyed diesel 0.0019 0.0500 0.0000 0.0495 0.1014

ethanol 0.0017 0.0500 0.2000 0.0495 0.3012


