
BID TABULATION

Bid Number: 09-06

Description: PD

Equipment

Time: 1:00

PM

Bids

Received: Date:11/17/2008

Vendor Name and Contact

Rear Security

Cage per Each

(order for 1)

Window

Barriers per

Set

(order for 1)

Light Bars

per Each

(order for 8)

Siren & Light

Control System

per Each

(order for 8)

Angled

per Each

(order for

2)

Consoles

per Each

(order for 3)

Graphics

per

Packages

(order for 5)

ICVS total 8

each

Radio per

Each

(order for

1)

Radar per

Each

(order for

3)

Speaker per

Each (of

MPH Ind 590.00 200.00 1830.00 970.00 620.00 550.00 299.00 205.00

Teletouch No Bid 150.00 1860.00 include w/light bar No Bid No Bid No Bid

include w/

light bar

Emergency Vehicle Supply 499.95 167.95 1795.00 include w/light bar 494.95 379.95 234.95

include w/

light bar

GT Distributors, Inc 446.90 158.90 1829.90 include w/light bar 364.90 424.90 294.50

include w/

light bar

American Communications 648.06 217.32 2276.00 include w/light bar 718.33 585.63 435.34

include w/

light bar

Graphics Designs International No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 195.00 No Bid

Adamson Industries Corp 518.89 154.00 1424.00 359.00 374.00 309 No Bid 139.00

Cop Stuff 383.00 130.00 1090.00 623.00 339.00 287.00 285.00 149.00

All American Sales Corp. 478.47 159.00 1074.00 626.14 340.40 314.50 274.00 94.86

Fleet Safety Equip 352.00 139.50 1248.00 ** 415.00** 419.00 419.00 389.00 109.00**

Big Country Supply 608.00

Included w/

Security

Cage 1300.00 550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 130.00

Big Country Supply 608.00

Included w/

Security

Cage 1599.00* include w/light bar No Bid No Bid No Bid

include w/

light bar

Austin Poma Did not satisfy bid requirements - an unresponsible bid

Decatur Electronics 1,245.00

Optics Planet 1,950.00

Stalker Radar 2,299.00

* LED 4 tier, plastic components not the better value

** Sold as a package better value. All components become wired as one unit, electrical problems and trouble shooting become a problem


