



Virgin Paper

	Speed Printing			Marfield Corporate Stationery			Advantage Resources Svcs.			Office Depot			The Right + Printer Ltd.			Copy Time ETC			Excel Printing			Hyper Motion			DOT Thermographic			
	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000 +	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	
8 1/2" x 11" 20# white	0.05	0.045	0.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.045	0.045	0.04	3.06(.03)	15.3(.03)	30.6(.03)	0.3939	0.2045	0.1845	0.07	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.04	02 -.03	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.06	0.03	0.02	
8 1/2" x 11" 20# color	0.07	0.065	0.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.07	0.065	0.05	3.66(.03)	18.3(.03)	36.6(.03)	0.4206	0.2193	0.198	0.09	0.07	0.065	0.06	0.05	03 -.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.08	0.05	0.04	
8 1/2" x 14" 20# white	0.05	0.045	0.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.05	0.045	0.04	4.22(.042)	21.1(.042)	42.2(.042)	0.398	0.2084	0.1884	0.07	0.06	0.05	0.06	0.05	03 -.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.09	0.07	0.05	
8 1/2" x 14" 20# color	0.075	0.065	0.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.77(.047)	23.85(.047)	47.7(.047)	0.4254	0.2239	0.2026	0.09	0.07	0.065	0.07	0.06	04 -.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.12	0.1	0.09	
NCR, Two Part	0.21	0.18	0.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.41(.17)	49.05(.09)	91.1(.09)	0.6253	0.4291	0.4082	0.2 [250min]	0.18	0.17	.17 set	.14 set	.11 set	0.15	0.13	0.11	0.24	0.18	0.14	
NCR, Two Part/Card Back	0.41	0.36	0.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	127(1.2)	127(.25)	207(.20)	0.8232	0.6088	0.5859	per job	per job	per job	0.29 set	0.26 set	.24 set	0.26	0.25	0.23	0.36	0.24	0.2	
NCR, Three Part - 1 color	0.35	0.29	0.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	102(1.02)	102(.20)	167(.16)	0.8232	0.6088	0.5859	.35 *	0.29	0.27	.23 set	.21 set	.18 set	0.17	0.15	0.13	0.3	0.24	0.2	
NCR, Three Part/Card Back	0.52	0.46	0.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	187(1.8)	187(.37)	292(.29)	1.2507	0.8582	0.8165	per job	per job	per job	.31 set	.28 set	.26 set	0.35	0.34	0.32	0.42	0.36	0.28	
NCR, Two Part - 2 color	0.44	0.32	0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	117(1.1)	117(.23)	192(.19)	0.6253	0.4291	0.4082	.44 [250min]	0.32	0.25	.2 set	.18 set	.15 set	0.19	0.17	0.15	0.48	0.32	0.22	
NCR, Two Part/Card Back - 2 color	0.54	0.44	0.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	167(1.6)	167(.33)	262(.26)	0.8232	0.6088	0.5859	per job	per job	per job	.31 set	.29 set	.26 set	0.34	0.33	0.32	0.54	0.35	0.27	
NCR, Three Part - 2 color	0.52	0.46	0.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	102(1.02)	102(.20)	167(.16)	0.8232	0.6088	0.5859	0.52	0.46	0.38	.25 set	.23 set	.20 set	0.22	0.21	0.19	0.59	0.39	0.29	
NCR, Three Part/Card Back - 2 color	0.72	0.61	0.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	182(1.82)	182(.36)	212(.21)	1.2507	0.8582	0.8165	per job	per job	per job	.33 set	.31 set	.28 set	0.38	0.37	0.35	0.64	0.44	0.34	
NCR, Two Part - 3 color	0.55	0.43	0.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	142(1.42)	142(.28)	192(.19)	0.6253	0.4291	0.4082	.63 [250min]	0.43	0.32	.32 set	.30 set	.28 set	0.22	0.2	0.19	0.75	0.48	0.33	
NCR, Two Part/Card Back-3 color	0.66	0.52	0.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	182(1.82)	182(.36)	232(.23)	0.8232	0.6088	0.5859	per job	per job	per job	.33 set	.31 set	.29 set	0.38	0.37	0.35	0.81	0.54	0.39	
NCR Three Part - 3 color	0.69	0.6	0.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	197(1.97)	197(.39)	262(.26)	0.8232	0.6088	0.5859	per job	0.69	0.6	0.47	.36 set	.34 set	.31 set	0.24	0.23	0.22	0.88	0.58	0.43
NCR Three Part/Card Back - 3 color	0.87	0.71	0.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	207(2.07)	207(.41)	292(.29)	1.2507	0.8582	0.8165	per job	per job	per job	.38 set	.36 set	.34 set	0.39	0.38	0.37	0.94	0.64	0.49	
8 1/2"X11" full color copies	.40 per side	.37 per side	.35 per side	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.465	0.465	.50/1500+	45(45)	107(.21)	162(.16)	0.4896	0.2588	0.2285	0.4	0.37	0.35	.34 set	.29 set	.22 -.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.17	0.16	0.15	
Business cards 2 color w/logo	0.095	0.07	0.06	\$14.45/500 (.02)	\$18.00/1000 (.018)	\$17.00/1000 (.017)	.35 -.105	.115 -.082	0.082	No Bid	52(.10)	55(.05)	0.1797	0.0617	0.0159	0.21	0.14	0.1	0.09	0.06	03 -.05	39(.07)	37(.07)	35(.07)	0.06	0.036	0.031	
Letterhead 2 color w/logo	0.25	0.17	0.12	\$59.25/500 (.058)	\$92.75/1000 (.092)	\$79.00/1000 (.079)	0.45	0.45	0.45	47(.47)	67(.13)	82(.08)	0.4343	0.2531	0.2054	0.27	0.18	0.13	0.2	0.17	12 -.14	89(.17)	79(.15)	69(.13)	0.16	0.12	0.1	
Letterhead -black/white	0.12	0.09	0.07	\$49.25/500 (.098)	\$80.00/1000 (.08)	\$68.00/1000 (.068)	0.115	0.08	0.0745	35(.35)	57(.11)	69(.069)	0.403	0.223	0.1756	0.12	0.09	0.08	0.1	0.09	06 -.08	69(.138)	64(.12)	60(.12)	0.1	0.08	0.06	
Envelopes #10-2 color logo	0.2	0.14	0.09	\$46.30/500 (.092)	\$66.85/1000 (.066)	\$56.00/1000 (.056)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57(.11)	69(.069)	100=\$174.00 500=\$201.00	500=\$201.00 1000=\$234.00	1000=\$234.00 2000=\$298.00 5000=\$460.00	0.25	0.16	0.11	0.2	0.17	12 -.14	89(.17)	85(.17)	79(.15)	0.13	0.09	0.07	
Envelopes #10-b/w	0.11	0.08	0.06	\$42.45/500 (.084)	\$61.30/1000 (.061)	\$51.40/1000 (.051)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27(.05)	44(.044)	100=\$36.00 500=\$58.00	500=\$58.00 1000=\$86.00	1000=\$86.00 2000=\$142.00 5000=\$288.00	0.11	0.08	0.07	0.1	0.09	06 -.08	69(.138)	65(.13)	59(.11)	0.09	0.07	0.05	
Envelopes #10 b/w window	0.12	0.09	0.07	\$43.10/500 (.086)	\$62.55/1000 (.062)	\$52.70/1000 (.052)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30(.06)	47(.047)	100=\$36.00 500=\$61.00	500=\$61.00 1000=\$91.00	1000=\$91.00 2000=\$152.00 5000=\$312.00	0.11	0.08	0.07	0.1	0.09	06 -.08	72(.144)	70(.14)	68(.13)	0.14	0.1	0.09	

Recycled Paper

	Speed Printing			Marfield Corporate Stationery			Advantage Resources Svcs.			Office Depot			The Right + Printer Ltd.			Copy Time ETC			Excel Printing			Hyper Motion			DOT Thermographic			
	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	100-500	500-1000	1000+	
8 1/2" x 11" 20# white	0.07	0.065	0.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.06(.03)	15.3(.03)	30.6(.03)	0.3996	0.21	0.1899	0.07	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.04	.02 - .03	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.05	0.03	0.02	
8 1/2" x 11" 20# color	0.09	0.085	0.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.66(.036)	18.3(.036)	36.6(.036)	0.4206	0.2193	0.198	0.09	0.07	0.065	0.06	0.05	.03 - .04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.07	0.05	0.04	
8 1/2" x 14" 20# white	0.07	0.065	0.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.22(.04)	21.1(.04)	42.2(.04)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.07	0.06	0.05	0.06	0.05	.03 - .04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.08	0.07	0.05	
8 1/2" x 14" 20# color	0.095	0.09	0.8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.77(.04)	23.85(.04)	47.7(.047)	0.4254	0.2239	0.2026	0.09	0.07	0.065	0.07	0.06	.04 - .05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.11	0.09	0.07	
NCR, Two Part	0.27	0.24	0.21	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.41(.17)	49.05(.09)	91.1(.09)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.20 [250min]	0.18	0.17	.17 set	.14 set	.11 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.24	0.18	0.14	
NCR, Two Part/Card Back	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	127(1.2)	127(.25)	207(.20)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	per job	per job	per job	0.29 set	0.26 set	.24 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.36	0.24	0.2	
NCR, Three Part	0.39	0.38	0.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	102(1.0)	102(.20)	167(.16)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.35 [150min]	0.29	0.27	.23 set	.21 set	.18 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.3	0.24	0.2	
NCR, Three Part/Card Back	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	187(1.8)	187(.37)	292(.29)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	per job	per job	per job	.31 set	.28 set	.26 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.42	0.36	0.28	
NCR, Two Part - 2 color	0.49	0.37	0.3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	117(1.1)	117(.23)	192(.19)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.44 [250min]	0.32	0.25	2 set	18 set	15 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.48	0.32	0.22	
NCR, Two Part/Card Back - 2 color	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	167(1.6)	167(.33)	262(.26)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	per job	per job	per job	.31 set	.29 set	.26 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.54	0.35	0.27	
NCR, Three Part - 2 color	0.59	0.54	0.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	102(1.1)	102(.20)	167(.16)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.52 [150min]	0.46	0.38	.25 set	.23 set	.20 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.59	0.39	0.29	
NCR, Three Part/Card Back - 2 color	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	182(1.82)	182(.36)	212(.21)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	per job	per job	per job	.33 set	.31 set	.28 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.64	0.44	0.34	
NCR, Two Part - 3 color	0.63	0.49	0.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	142(1.42)	142(.28)	192(.19)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.63 [250min]	0.43	0.32	.32 set	.30 set	.28 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.75	0.48	0.33	
NCR, Two Part/Card Back - 3 color	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	182(1.8)	182(.36)	232(.23)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	per job	per job	per job	.33 set	.31 set	.29 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.81	0.54	0.39	
NCR Three Part - 3 color	0.77	0.68	0.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	197(1.97)	197(.394)	262(.26)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.69 [150min]	0.6	0.47	.36 set	.34 set	.31 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.88	0.58	0.43	
NCR Three Part/Card Back - 3 color	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	207(2.0)	207(.41)	292(.29)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	per job	per job	per job	.38 set	.36 set	.34 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.94	0.64	0.49	
8 1/2"X11" full color copies	0.45	0.42	0.4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	45 (.45)	107(.21)	162(.16)	0.4953	0.2643	0.2339	0.4	0.37	0.35	.34 set	.29 set	.22 - .25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.17	0.16	0.15	
Business cards 2 color w/logo	0.11	0.09	0.08	\$14.45/500 (.028)	\$18.00/1000 (.018)	\$17.00/1000 (.017)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	52 (.10)	55 (.055)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.21 [250min]	0.14	0.1	0.09	0.06	.03 - .05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.06	0.036	0.031	
Letterhead 2 color w/logo	0.26	0.18	0.13	\$59.25/500 (.11)	\$92.75/1000 (.092)	\$79.00/1000 (.079)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	47 (.47)	67 (.13)	82 (.082)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.27 [250min]	0.18	0.13	0.2	0.17	.12 - .14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.16	0.12	0.1
Letterhead -black/white	0.13	0.1	0.075	\$49.25/500 (.098)	\$80.00/1000 (.080)	\$68.00/1000 (.068)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	35 (.35)	57 (.11)	69 (.069)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.12 [250min]	0.09	0.08	0.1	0.09	.06 - .08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1	0.08	0.06
Envelopes #10-2 color logo	0.22	0.16	0.11	\$54.40/500 (.10)	\$83.10/1000 (.083)	\$71.00/1000 (.071)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57 (.11)	69 (.069)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.25	0.16	0.11	0.2	0.17	.12 - .14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.13	0.09	0.07	
Envelopes #10-b/w	0.12	0.1	0.08	\$52.90/500 (.10)	\$79.80/1000 (.0798)	\$67.70/1000 (.067)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27 (.054)	69(.069)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.11	0.08	0.07	0.1	0.09	.06 - .08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.09	0.07	0.05	
Envelopes #10 b/w window	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56.80/500 (.11)	\$87.55/1000 (.08)	\$75.00/1000 (.075)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30 (.06)	47(.047)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.11	0.08	0.07	0.1	0.09	.06 - .08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.14	0.1	0.09	

Office Depot					
100-500	500-100	1000+			
100	500	1000			
3.06	15.3	30.6	0.0306	0.0306	0.0306
3.66	18.3	36.6	0.0366	0.0366	0.0366
4.22	21.1	42.2	0.0422	0.0422	0.0422
4.77	23.85	47.7	0.0477	0.0477	0.0477
17.41	49.05	91.1	0.1741	0.0981	0.0911
127	127	207	1.27	0.254	0.207
102	102	167	1.02	0.204	0.167
187	187	292	1.87	0.374	0.292
117	117	192	1.17	0.234	0.192
167	167	262	1.67	0.334	0.262
102	102	167	1.02	0.204	0.167
182	182	212	1.82	0.364	0.212
142	142	192	1.42	0.284	0.192
182	182	232	1.82	0.364	0.232
197	197	262	1.97	0.394	0.262
207	207	292	2.07	0.414	0.292
45	107	162	0.45	0.214	0.162
No Bid	52	55		0.104	0.055
47	67	82	0.47	0.134	0.082
35	57	69	0.35	0.114	0.069
No Bid	57	69		0.114	0.069
No Bid	27	44		0.054	0.044
No Bid	30	47		0.06	0.047