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47 each Hard hat V-guard white in color with
ratchet suspension. Meets or exceeds
ANSI Z89.1-2003, type 1, class E & G.

 No Bid  No Bid  $11.25    $15.00  $11.73  $3.75  $7.95      $17.78  $9.95  $8.95  $10.90  $8.45  $11.47  $13.65   
ask to 
refax  $20.00  $6.95  $6.50  $11.63  $6.89  $13.58      $4.65        $12.33  $9.90  $3.54  $14.68  $9.68  $11.66  $9.50 

25 boxes Ear plugs with strings, orange in color #
Max 30 or equal  No Bid  No Bid  $23.75    $25.00  $15.50  $22.50  $22.95      $29.57  $20.95  $20.46  $18.65  $16.50  $24.93  $18.00      $35.25  $16.95  $40.00  $17.70  $20.60  $21.55  $31.51    $19.70        $22.04  $17.87  $16.25  $25.88  $17.80  $34.43  $18.00 

30 each Traffic flag 18” x 18” with 30” handle
(orange)  No Bid  $2.50  $3.45    $3.50  $3.31  $2.50         $5.78  $2.75  $2.05    $2.29  $2.47  $2.42      $7.00  $2.50  $3.25  $1.78  $3.43         $2.75  $1.90  $2.00      $2.71  $3.29  $4.65  $2.30  $3.56  $2.40 

137 each LG class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $8.05  $13.90    $10.00  $7.60  $18.30  $8.95        $17.75  $19.94    $24.70  $22.87  $16.44      $18.50  $14.95    $16.96  $19.63  $9.59      $21.52  $12.35  $9.95    $23.76  $19.01  $9.51  $13.56  $9.50 

108 each XL class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $8.05  $13.90    $10.00  $7.60  $18.30  $8.95        $17.75  $19.94    $24.70  $22.87  $16.44      $20.25  $14.95    $16.96  $19.63  $9.59      $21.52  $12.35  $9.95    $23.76  $19.01  $9.51  $13.56  $9.50 

52 each 2XL class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $8.05  $13.90    $10.00  $7.60  $18.30  $8.95        $19.50  $21.93    $24.70  $22.87  $16.44      $18.50  $14.95    $16.96  $19.68  $9.59      $23.60  $12.35  $95.00    $26.66  $19.01  $9.51  $13.56  $9.50 

56 each 3XL class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $8.05  $13.90    $10.00  $7.60  $19.65  $8.95        $21.25  $23.93    $24.70  $22.87  $16.94      $18.50  $15.95    $17.75  $19.58  $9.59      $25.66  $12.35  $10.95    $26.66  $20.01  $9.51  $13.56  $9.50 

10 each 4XL class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $9.10  $13.90    $11.50  $7.60  $20.95  $8.95        $23.00  $25.92    $24.70  $22.87  $17.90      $20.25  $15.95    $18.54  $19.72  $9.59      $27.73  $12.97  $11.95    $26.66  $20.01  $10.74  $13.56  $10.75 

5each 5XL class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $9.10  $13.90    $11.50  $7.60  $22.30  $8.95        $24.75  $29.91    $24.70  $22.87  $20.00      $20.25  $15.95        $9.59      $31.86  $12.97  $12.95    $26.66  $20.01  $10.74  $13.56  $10.75 

5 each 6XL class II lime mesh break away safety
vest With “City of Huntsville” stenciled
on the back Meets or exceeds ANSI/ISEA
107-2004 class2 Flame retardant meets
16 CFR 1610 class 1std.

 No Bid  $9.10  $13.90    $11.50  $8.25  $23.65  $8.95        $26.50  $29.91    $24.70    $21.00        $16.95                $13.62  $13.95      $20.01  $10.74    $10.75 

6 each M- medium duty rain coat
PVC/Polyester minimum 48” long Non
conductive and non corrosive (yellow in
color) 2- piece with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $6.25  $5.00  $9.00  $3.50  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.13  $4.02  $3.24  $29.62  $3.80      $22.50  $7.95  $6.80  $4.83  $3.40  $4.27  $13.76    $5.00  $11.00  $6.95    $3.23  $4.69  $4.71  $9.09  $4.00  $8.51  $5.00 

15 each L medium duty  rain coat PVC/Polyester
minimum 48” long Non conductive and
non corrosive (yellow in color) 2- piece
with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $6.25  $5.00  $9.00  $3.50  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.13  $4.02  $3.24  $29.62  $3.80      $22.50  $7.95  $6.80  $4.83  $3.40  $4.27  $13.76    $5.00  $11.00  $6.95    $3.23  $4.69  $4.71  $8.48  $4.00  $8.51  $4.75 

36 each XL medium duty  rain coat
PVC/Polyester minimum 48” long Non
conductive and non corrosive (yellow in
color) 2- piece with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $6.25  $5.00  $9.00  $3.50  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.13  $4.02  $3.24  $29.62  $3.80      $22.50  $7.95  $6.80  $4.83  $3.40  $4.27  $13.76    $5.00  $10.00      $3.23  $4.69  $4.71  7.878.26  $4.00  $8.51  $4.75 

26 each 2XL medium duty rain coat
PVC/Polyester Minimum 48”long, non
conductive and non corrosive (yellow in
color) 2- piece with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $6.25  $5.00  $9.00  $3.50  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.13  $4.22  $3.24  $29.62  $3.80    $6.06  $35.75  $7.95  $6.80  $4.83  $3.40  $4.49  $13.76    $5.00  $10.00  $6.95    $3.23  $4.87  $4.71  $9.33  $4.25  $8.51  $5.00 

16 each 3XL medium duty  rain coat
PVC/Polyester Minimum 48”long, non
conductive and non corrosive (yellow in
color) 2- piece with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $7.50  $5.00  $9.00  $3.86  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.54  $4.43  $3.24  $32.18  $3.80    $6.18  $36.50  $8.50  $6.90  $5.32  $3.40  $4.71  $15.14    $5.00  $12.00  $6.95    $3.23  $5.10  $4.71  $10.45  $4.45  $8.51 

10 each 4XL medium duty  rain coat
PVC/Polyester Minimum 48”long, non
conductive and non corrosive (yellow in
color) 2- piece with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $7.50  $5.00  $9.00  $3.86  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.54  $4.62  $3.24  $32.18  $4.22    $6.37  $12.50  $8.50  $7.15  $5.32  $3.40  $4.93  $15.14    $5.00  $13.00  $7.95      $5.34  $4.71    $4.65  $8.51 

18 each 5XL medium duty rain coat
PVC/Polyester Minimum 48”long, non
conductive and non corrosive (yellow in
color) 2- piece with detachable hood

 No Bid  $3.40  $7.50  $5.00  $9.00  $3.86  $4.70  $6.95    $6.55  $4.50  $8.54  $4.83  $3.24  $32.18  $4.22    $6.57  $13.50  $8.50  $7.35  $5.32  $3.40  $5.14  $15.14    $5.00  $14.00        $7.09  $4.71  $7.05  $4.85 

1each M – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket, and hood)

 No Bid  $4.18  $7.50  $6.99  $10.00  $4.45  $4.95  $8.95  $6.80  $7.83  $5.35  $9.06  $4.51  $3.95  $192.72  $4.22    $5.23  $21.00  $9.50  $8.25  $5.65  $4.53  $5.86  $15.75    $6.50  $11.00  $5.95    $4.66  $6.16  $4.71  $7.05  $5.35  $16.91  $7.50 

11each L – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket, and hood)

 No Bid  $4.18  $7.50  $6.99  $10.00  $4.45  $4.95  $8.95  $6.80  $7.83  $5.35  $9.06  $4.51  $3.95  $192.72  $5.00    $5.23  $21.00  $9.50  $8.25  $5.65  $4.53  $5.86  $15.75    $6.50  $11.00  $5.95    $4.66  $6.16  $4.71  $7.05  $5.35  $16.91  $7.25 

25each XL – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket, and hood)

 No Bid  $4.18  $7.50  $6.99  $10.00  $4.45  $4.95  $8.95  $6.80  $7.83  $5.35  $9.06  $4.51  $3.95  $192.72  $5.00    $5.23  $21.00  $9.50  $8.25  $5.65  $4.53  $5.86  $15.75    $6.50  $11.00  $5.95    $4.66  $6.16  $4.71  $7.05  $5.35  $16.91  $7.25 

20 each 2XL – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket, and hood)

 No Bid  $4.18  $7.50  $6.99  $10.00  $4.45  $4.95  $8.95  $6.80  $7.83  $5.85  $9.51  $4.73  $3.95  $192.72  $5.00    $5.23  $21.00  $9.50  $8.25  $5.65  $4.53  $5.86  $15.75    $6.50  $11.00  $5.95    $4.66  $6.47  $4.71  $7.64  $5.60  $16.91  $7.25 

28 each 3XL – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket, and hood)

 No Bid  $4.18  $8.75  $6.99  $10.00  $4.80  $4.95  $8.95  $6.80  $7.83  $6.00  $9.51  $4.96  $3.95  $227.53  $5.00    $5.42  $21.00  $9.95  $8.35  $5.65  $4.53  $5.86  $17.32    $6.50  $12.00  $6.95    $4.66  $6.77  $4.71  $7.64  $5.88  $16.91  $8.00 

10 each 4XL – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket,  and hood)

 No Bid  $4.18  $8.75  $6.99  $10.00  $4.80  $4.95  $8.95  $7.10  $7.83  $6.00  $9.51  $5.18  $3.95  $212.89  $5.00    $5.55  $18.00  $9.95  $8.60  $16.13  $4.53  $5.86  $17.32    $6.50  $12.00  $6.95    $4.66  $7.08  $4.71  $8.22  $6.15  $18.86  $8.25 

7 each 5XL – medium duty rain suit
PVC/Polyester, yellow in color, Non
conductive and non corrosive 3- piece
(bib style overall, jacket, and hood)

 No Bid  $4.80  $8.75  $6.99  $10.00  $4.80  $4.95  $8.95  $7.10  $7.83  $6.00  $9.51  $5.40  $3.95    $5.15    $5.55  $18.25  $9.95  $8.80  $16.13  $4.53  $5.86  $17.32    $6.50  $13.00  $6.95    $4.66  $8.52  $4.71  $16.55  $6.45  $18.86  $8.75 

4 each Black PVC rain boot  size 7” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.20  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $5.15    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00        $11.50  $12.71  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $19.00 

9 each Black PVC rain boot  size 8” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $10.50    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00    $9.95    $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $21.42  $18.00 

20 each Black PVC rain boot  size 9” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $10.50    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00    $9.95    $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $21.42  $18.75 

32 each Black PVC rain boot  size 10” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $10.50    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00    $9.95    $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $21.42  $18.75 

39 each Black PVC rain boot  size 11” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $10.50    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00    $9.95    $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $21.42  $18.75 

22 each Black PVC rain boot  size 12” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $10.50    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00    $9.95    $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $21.42  $19.00 

25 each Black PVC rain boot  size 13” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $15.38  $10.50    $34.00  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $10.00    $9.95    $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00  $21.42  $19.00 

6 each Black PVC rain boot  size 14” (steel toe)
For general construction work. 16” from
heel to top of sleeve  No Bid  No Bid  $13.75  $14.00  $11.75  $11.70  $11.25  $20.95    $22.20  $17.95  $12.50  $8.52  $8.75  $18.92  $10.50    $37.50  $11.95    $10.16  $14.93  $12.82    $14.35  $12.25        $11.50  $12.79  $11.15  $16.55  $10.00 

77 each Safety glasses (crews) BK 110 equal or
better  No Bid  No Bid  $1.32    $1.50  $0.98  $1.00  $1.95    $1.53  $1.65  $4.04  $1.38  $0.98  $0.98  $1.80  $0.95  $1.50  $1.02  $7.25  $1.40    $1.11  $1.05  $1.08  $2.16    $1.40        $1.00  $1.08  $1.06  $1.63  $1.05  $8.86  $1.25 

520 each Safety glasses (crews) BK 112 equal or
better  No Bid  No Bid  $1.38    $1.60  $1.10  $1.00  $1.95      $1.80  $3.71  $1.38  $0.98  $1.05  $2.01  $1.05  $1.50  $1.15  $10.00  $1.45    $1.11  $1.05  $1.10  $2.38    $1.59        $1.03  $1.08  $1.12  $1.68  $1.20  $8.86  $1.45 

1583 pair XL string knit gloves PVC double sided
dots, reversible, seamless.  No Bid  $0.33  $0.37  $0.63  $0.50  $0.43  $0.42  $11.95  $4.00    $0.44  $0.52  $0.40  $0.44  $0.26  $0.74  $0.35  $0.55  $5.29  $200.00  $0.47  $0.50  $0.87  $0.51  $0.37      $0.40        $0.38  $1.24  $0.45  $0.83  $0.29  $0.88  $1.71 

1348 pair Foam nitrile palm coated gloves Size 10
or large  No Bid  No Bid  $2.24    $3.25  $1.32  $1.20  $31.95      $1.66  $2.50  $1.36  $1.93  $0.92  $2.42  $1.10  $1.10    $1.19    $0.98  $2.36  $5.01      $2.65        $1.70  $3.15  $1.29  $3.49  $1.65  $1.25 

154 pair Large black PVC coated lined gloves 12”
long Rough grip  No Bid  No Bid  $1.18  $1.40  $1.50  $0.88  $0.90  $1.95    $4.22  $1.79  $1.05  $0.97  $0.85  $0.70  $2.71  $1.25  $1.15  $12.00  $0.99  $17.85  $1.28  $1.19  $2.03      $1.40        $1.10  $16.25  $0.88  $1.51  $1.75  $2.66  $1.50 

300 pair Large -unlined cowhide driver’s glove
top grain cowhide with split leather
back- Select grade, and keystone
pattern  No Bid  $2.22  $3.64    $3.00  $2.60  $3.15  $7.95      $5.48  $3.98  $3.44  $2.98  $2.38  $6.15  $3.60  $2.50    $3.95    $3.07  $3.40  $3.15      $3.90        $2.30  $5.04  $3.04  $3.71  $3.13  $13.66  $3.25 

600 pair XLarge –unlined cowhide driver’s glove
top grain cowhide with split leather
back- Select grade, and keystone
pattern  No Bid  $2.22  $3.64    $3.10  $2.60  $3.15  $7.95      $5.48  $3.98  $3.44  $3.12  $2.38  $6.15  $3.60  $2.50    $4.50    $3.35  $3.53  $3.45      $4.09        $2.30  $5.39  $3.24  $3.71  $3.13  $13.66  $3.25 

30 box Large- nitrile industrial gloves 8 mil.
Latex free, powder free, textured,
Ambidextrous.  $8.58  No Bid  $8.00    $6.75  $9.25  $6.20  $24.95    $7.22  $6.54  $11.50  $5.44  $7.38  $10.50  $11.26  $7.50  $6.25  $7.91    $9.95    $7.24  $8.32  $8.54      $5.85      $5.40  $5.95  $5.26  $6.39  $24.99  $7.35  $9.86  $6.50 

23 box Large- latex textured exam gloves,
Heavy duty powder free, 12” long, 15
mil  $8.43  No Bid  $12.82    $5.75  $7.77  $7.20  $7.95    $4.25  $95.14  $9.95  $7.50  $7.44  $4.32  $12.29  $82.00  $8.25  $7.91    $9.95    $10.04  $8.39  $8.62      $8.75        $9.75  $6.76  $6.89  $8.82  $7.55  $18.89  $10.50 

There may be on rare occasions items
not listed which may need special order.
Please list cost plus percentage (%)
from your invoice offered to City.
Example your invoice price is $30.00 and
cost plus percentage is 25%.  Final City
of Huntsville price will be $37.50.
Vendor may be requested to send copy
of their invoice.

30%  No Bid 25% 27% 40% 15% varies 20% 18% 15% 20% 20% 10% 0% 25% 20% 18% 25%  $-   

Minimum order required  $84.30  $-    $100.00  $300.00  $500.00  $-    $300.00  $1,000.00  $-    $50.00  $500.00  $750.00  $100.00  $100.00  $-    $-      $100.00  $200.00        $-    $100.00  $100.00  $-    $100.00  $25.00  $500.00  $100.00  $54.00  $-      $300.00  $500.00  $100.00  $-    $-   
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