Bid No. 01-10-07
Sack Ready mix concrete

Bid Tabulation

Date: February 5. 2010

Time 1:30 Central Time

n

Number Charge for | Net Price Minimum
Price per | Bags per Pallets Not | Sack Ready | Order # of
Bidder Name Bidder Address Bag Pallet Returned | per Pallet Pallets
Logans Marketing San Diago, CA 3.65 42 15.00 153.30 1
** McCoys Huntsville, TX 3.44 42 20.00 174.48 1
Walker & Byrd Huntsville, TX 4.29 42 15.00 180.18 42
Biko Engineerging Hernando, FL 4.35 42 25.00 182.70 8
84 Lumber Eighty-four, PA 4.40 42 0.00 184.80 0
Old Castle Houston, TX 6.48 42 0.00 272.16 2
Walker County Hardware Huntsville, TX No Bid
Quickrete of West Texas Midland, TX No Bid
Job Distributing Huntsville, TX No Bid
Thomas Supply Livingston, TX No Bid
Contractors Supply Lufkin, TX No Bid

Bid Sync

Electronic State Business Daily

Huntsville Web Site

** McCoys adds 30.00 per delivery, Order by each price per pallet becomes 144.48 + 30.00 = 174.48

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

Billie Smith (Purchasing Manager)

Saul Soto (Buyer)




