Marimon Business A

Yes

S 35,853.18 0 0
Pitney Bowes S 19,502.92 55% Yes 0 0
Dahill S 18,712.06 40 Yes 0 0
Marimon Business B S 11,002.70 No Bid Yes 38 0
Magnetic Imaging 5 16,990.02 20 Yes 0 0
Remark Imaging 5 18,473.66 25 yes 0 200
Laser Cycle S 30,101.52 Various Yes 5 30
3-C Technology S 43,275.74 4 yes 1 0
The Office Pal Late Bid
Voltex 5 17,550.70 Various Yes 0 1
Alpha Sum 3 34,968.00 40 Yes 0 50
Laser Saver 5 24,083.28 40 Yes 0 50
Cartridge World S 20,046.38 40 Yes 1 0
Alpha B2B S 21,121.84 25 YEs ) 100
LD Products 5 9,514.88 Various Yes 28 0
MCPC S 35,611.90 6 Yes 6 0
Martek Supply S 15,812.50 45 No 0 50
Comp Usa $ 42,097.52 12 Yes 14 75
Supplies Now s 18,260.72 30 Yes 0 0
Sustain S 18,347.36 74 Yes 0 0
Printer Cartridge Supply Late Bid
SDF S 35,969.34 5 Yes 12 50
Xerox S 26,862.40 No Bid Yes 61 500
World Wide Image 5 22,699.80 30 Yes 29 ¥
Quality ink 4 Less S 21,315.90 No Bid Yes 67 0
ACP Direct S 31,025.62 0 Yes 62 100
EIS S 14,871.02 10 Yes 0 47
The Tree House S 34,753.11 30 Yes 0 100
Office Depot S 25,772.25 Various Yes 16 0
Flores Associates S 21,190.40 15 Yes 1 100
Orion Group S 28,332.80 No Bid No 0 25
Atlaz International S 923.60 No Bid No Bid Numerous Unknown
Cartridge World B S 12,174.92 No Bid Yes Numerous 45
ELP Ent. S 20,079.60 10 Yes 1 200
3 C Technology S 43,406.42 4 Yes 2 0
Steven Enterprises S 38,222.30 Various Unknown 3 0
Nu Image ) 37,524.00 No Bid No 19 50
Logan Marketing S 14,956.40 3 Yes 20 0
Compro Global 5 14,663.62 15 No Bid 10 0

Coast to Coast

No Response

Metro Business

No Response

Discount Laser

No Response

Call One Stop

No Response




