Product Texas Best Transit Mix
3000 PSI with 1" Limestan
Per Cubic Yard delivered 5 yards or greater S 73.00 No Bid
Per Cubic Yard delivered 5 yards or less S 76.00 No Bid
Per Cubic Yard add 500 PSI to base S 2.00 No Bid

Per Cubic Yard delivered 5 <m.&m or greater

Per Cubic Yard delivered 5 yards or less

76.00

No Bid

Per Cubic Yard add 500 PSI to base

2.00

No Bid

Price-if river.rock .

Per Cubic Yard delivered 5 yards or greater S 73.00 No Bid
Per Cubic Yard delivered 5 yards or less S 76.00 No Bid
Per Cubic Yard add 500 PSi to base S 2.00 No Bid
Price with mixtures

Fiber mesh 1.5 S 7.00 No Bid
2% HE Calcium S 3.00 No Bid
Retarder S 3.00 No Bid
Accelerator S 4.00 No Bid
Plasticizer S 4.00 No Bid
Average Response Time 1-2 hours

Concrete washed sand S 14.00 15.00

Bid maybe awarded in whole or by parts

. QW” /.19 a0

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

Billie Smith {Purchasing Manager)




