Weisner Tarrant Caldwell Pricing - Pricing - Grapevine
Low GMC- Randell Reed | Pricing - 5 Star | 5 5tar Sam | County Ferd | Philpett - Philpoit- Meador - Meador - Dodge -
Extended Extended Responder | Huntsville, | Prestige Ford { Sam Pack Ford- | Pack Ford- & Chevy- Ford- Pt Ford- Pt. Dodge - Bt, | Dodge -Ft, | Grapevine,
ITEM Description Budget | Quantity Budget Auction Value i Auction Value Maodel TX Garland, TX | Carrollton, TX- |Carvollton, TX| Caldwell, TX [Neches, TX -| Neches, TX | Worth, TX - | Worth, TX TX
1/2 Ton Pick up SRR
1iRegular Cab 4 16,000.00 2 §  3z00000(% 1522.00] % 3,044.00| FordF150 1$19,722.61 [  15,20000 | 3 16,539.00 | §  15,874.00 15.717.00 No Bid $ 15,885.00 $ 18873.00 15 1743400
1/2 Ton Pick up o .
2 |Extended Cab $ 16,000.00 1 5 16,000.00( % 1,522.00| % 1,522.00| FordF150 |$25285800!3 1375000 (S 19,146.00 [ §  18,962.00 182770085 19481.00 [ § 18,747.00 | $ 1857100 | & 18,618.00 | No Bid
1/2 Ton Pick up Dodge Ram Sl onnn
3|Extended Cab4 x4 | $19,000,00 2 $  38,00000| % 1,700.00| & 3,400,00 1500 §27,747.50 [ § 211500098 21,521.00 | 208110088 206910005 21,235.00 | § 2094800 | 5§ 20,938.00 } § 20,556.00. | 5 21,390.00
3/4 Tan Pick Up Alternate ¥ RN
4|Ragular Cab item -| FordF25e | 532521500 |4 1885000 |5 18,519.00 N 18,269.004 5  18,288.00 | No Bid $ 1889400 $ 2049800 | §  21,043.00
3/4 Ton Pick up ? ; .
5|Extended Cab $19,000.00 5 $  95,00000|% 1,374.00| 5 5,870,00} FordF 250 | $27,906.51 [$ 2075000 | § 20,6568.00 &S . 20,187.00 vm 2025700 | $ 21,954.00 [ & 20,897.00 No Bid 4 21,076.00
3/4Ton Pick up Crew |  Alternate Dodge Ram T ey FERRaER
5A[cab - Upgrade ttem - 2500 £29,78651 |§ 21975004 % 22,119.00 | § 21,578.00 21,524.00 23,045.00 |3 21,999.00 ; § 10,932.00 $  21,076.00
1 Ton Pick up Crew VL
6|Cab w/Service Bad $ 20,000.00 1 5 30,000.00] % 5,000.00| $ 5,000.00§ Ford F 350 |No Bid $ 2975000 | & 30,504 .00 5 30,216.00 Na Bid 5 32,068.00 No Bid No Bid
1 Ton Pick up Crew
Cab-truck anly no Alternate
6A|service bed tem H - Ford F350 | $31,542.31 |$ 24,150.00 | § 24,108.00 S 23,837.00 Na Bid S 24,198.00 No Bid No Bid
Mid Size Sedan - Alternate 5 ——r i
7l5mall Item - | Ford Fusion No Bid % 1535000 |5 15,377.00 | $714,974.00 | 5 15,644.00 No Sid S 15,908.00 5 1644900 ! 5 15,387.00
Dodge : ]
B{Mid Size Sedan - Med | § 19,000.00 1 5 19.000.00] & 1,886.00] & 1,886.00) Avenger LS Na Bid Hw..oqm.SL-m 20,583.00 ] 5 20,478.00 $18,976.00 No Bid $ 20,258,00 No Bid
Mid Size Sedan - Alternate Ford Crown e :
BA|Large ftem - Vic No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $  25,256.00 No Bid No Bid 5 NN,ummF
Law Enforcement Chevrolet
9[suv $ 27,500.00 3 $  77,532.00| § 1,500.00| $ 5,700.00( Tahoe PPV No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid A $ 25,844.00, No Bid Na Bid Ne Bid
Chevrolet e
10 |Police Cruiser $ 22,500.00 z 5 45,000.00| 5 1,826.00| § 3,772.00 | Irmpala Police ;ﬁ- No Bid No Bid No Bid $°20,887.00 No Bid No Bid 5 21,638.00 No Bid
Total Estimated Circle notes
Budget 352,532,00 Auction 5 31,194,00 award

Itemn D - Auction Value assumes whole and saleable condition
Itern O 3 - Meador Dodge - Bid requested 3.73 axel equal or better, Meadar hid 2.55 axel- informality waived
ttem O 5A- Meacor Dadge - Bid requested 6.2 L V8 engine gqual or better, Meador bid 5.7 | V8 engine- informality waived
Item P - Grapevine Dodge - Bid delivered to incorrect focation, Bid delivered properiy and on time - informality waived
Item 1K - Caldwell Country - Bid requested LT2245 75R all terrain tire for $15,717. Bid had 2 prices one with aiternate tire P 235 all terrain tire, price of $15,488 = price differance $229. Standard tlre for F150 is the P235 75R,
ftam 2 - Budget 516,000 low responder $18,277 price differance = $2,277
{tem 3 - Budget $15,000 low responder $20,556 price difference = 51,556
Item 3 - Extended Cab 1/2 Ton - Meador Dodge low responder $20,556 Caldwell Ford $20,651 price difference = 5135
Item 5 - Budget $19,000 low responder $20,187 price difference = $1,187
Item 5A - .w\.a Tan Extended Cab - Department upgrade requested te Crew Cab - Crew Cab low responder Meadar Dedger $20,225, Extended Cab low responder 5 Star Ford $20,187 price difference = $33.
'.,. Department requests Ford Crew Cab. Ford Crew Cab low responder, $21,524 - Dodge Crew Cab low responder $20,225 price difference = $1,295 )
Iteift BA - 1 Ten with cab no service bed 523,522 cost of service bed + 55,799 = $29,321.00 truck with service bed best value to order as unit with turnkey insta fatian to ensure proper fit and prevent delay in service date
|tern 7 - Caldwell Country bid 2 vehicles low responder is a 4 door Chevy Malibu 516,988, alternate Is a Ford Fusion 514,974
ltern 7,8 & 34 are pool cars ltem 7 bids include Fusion, Maiibu & Avenger 4 cylinder, [tem 3 bids include Impala, Avenger and Taurus, Item 84 hids include Crown Vic, and Caprice
lterr 9 & 10 - Police SUV and Cruisers dees not include wi

g harness ar police accessories - accessaories Includes light bars, radio, in-car video system, cages etc.
After approval of base vehicle wiring and accessories will be added/bid. ltems have been budgeted separately & not included in this budget amount
Itern 9 & 10 - Police Departnent recommends Chevrelet Tahae and Impala for their oparations. Ford Crown Vic has been discounted.
PD to test and evaiuate different mode!s then make a determination to standardize fieet
{tern 9M - Phitpott Ford bid Ford Expedition SUV - Ford Expedition in Fleet due to Ford's uncertai
Bid maybe awarded in whole or by parts

in police vehicles PD reguests Tahee to conduct testing and evaluation

*NOTICEpBi is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal autherizatlon by City offi
Q 12,33 \\

e Smith {Purchasing Manager)




