North Star
***zrisham Pavers Supply|Plumbing- Cleveland, Performance Martin Ergon
Construction - |- Huntsville, |Huntsville, |Asphalt - Grade Ashpalt - JAsphalt - TXI Operations|Asphalt - Vulcan Materials {Transit Mix -
Huntsville, TX |TX X Shepherd, TX |Hitchcock, TX Houston, TX |- Dallas, TX Austin, TX |San Antonio, TX |Huntsville, TX
Price per Unit of |Price per Unit |Price per Unit {Price per Unit |Price per Unitof  |Price per Unit {Price per Unit of | Price per Unit|Price per Unit of  [Price per Unit of
Description Unit of Measure Measure of Measurc of Measure of Measure Measure of Measure Measure of Measure  [Measure Measure
ot Mix Price per Ton No Bid §  65.00 [NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
_Eas%_m Fill Mixture  |Price per Cybic Yard  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 62.00
_Eec._u_n Base Price per Cubic Ton $ 30.00 | $ 23.88 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
|cement Stabilized Base | Price per Cubic Ton No Bid $ 34.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trap Rock Price per Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 62.95 | No Bid
(CRS-2 Asphalt Price per Gatlon No Bid No Bid No Bid $  23134|% 2108 2.35 | No Bid 3 2.46 | NoBid No Bid
3/8" Chip Rock Price per Ton No Bid $ 34.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34.62 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8" Chip Rock Price per Ton No Bid 5 34.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 40.62 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
on Soil Price per Cubic Yard
op 50 Delivered $ 950 | $ 27.00 | 3 10.74 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Soil Price per Cubic Yard
Top Soi Picked-up $ 5008 2000 | $3.00%  [NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥l Di Price per Cubic Yard
_ b Delivered $ 7.50 | § 17.00 | § 8.52 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Price per Cubic Yard
Fill Dirt Picked-up $ 400 (% 10.00 | $1.00 ** No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tﬁ Raw/Washed Price per Cubic Yard
Concrete Sand Delivered No Bid $ 23.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5 21.00
Pure Raw/Washed Price per Cubic Yard
Concrete Sand Picked-up No Bid i 16.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 19.60
Stabilized Sand , Price per Cubic Yard
tabilized San Delivered No Bid $ 36.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PricE per Cubic Yard
Stabilized Sand Picked-up No Bid $ 29.00 {No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

** North Star Plumbing bid as self load / not picked up

*** Pavers Supply bid in tons not cubic yards - price reflets ton price - 1 cubic yard =1.35 tons

*** Grisham bid delivered to wrong locaton

Bid maybe awarded in whole or parts

NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor mecting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

TISS

e
Billig Smith (Purchasing Manager)




