



Bid Tabulation

Description	Atlantic Coast Polymer			DXI			Altiva			Strategy Sources			Carus Corp.		
	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met
Chlorine in gas form One (1) ton cylinder	No Bid			\$ 611.00			No Bid			\$ 975.00	1		No Bid		
Sulfur Dioxide in gas form (1) ton cylinder	No Bid			\$ 758.00			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate Price per (1)gal.	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Polyacrylamide based Flocculant Price per 55 gallon drum	\$ 594.00	4.00	\$ 650.00	No Bid			\$ 828.00	10	\$ 840.00	No Bid			No Bid		
Hydrofluorisisitic Acid Price per (1) gallon	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Polyposphate Calgon C 5 Price per 30 gallon drum	No Bid			No Bid			\$ 291.00	10	\$ 321.00	No Bid			\$ 245.25	5	\$ 251.79

Bid may be awarded in whole or by parts

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

[Signature]
Billie Smith (Purchasing Manager)

Bid Tabulation

Description	Ashland		General Chemical		Shannon Chemical		Nalco Co		F2 Industries			
	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met
Chlorine in gas form One (1) ton cylinder	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
Sulfur Dioxide in gas form (1) ton cylinder	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate Price per (1)gal.	No Bid		\$4.59/\$1.122	600/4,500	TBD	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			
Polyacrylamide based Flocculant Price per 55 gallon drum	\$ 652.50	0	\$ 652.50			No Bid	\$ 905.98	0	No Bid			
Hydrofluoridic Acid Price per (1) gallon	No Bid					No Bid			No Bid			
Polyphosphate Calgon C 5 Price per 30 gallon drum	No Bid					\$ 293.10	30	\$ 308.10	\$ 370.60	0	\$ 235.80	0

Bid maybe awarded in

*NOTICE: Bid award is c

Billie Smith (Purchasing

Bid Tabulation

SNF Polydyne			
Description	Unit Price	Minimum Order req. per Shipment	Unit price if Min. order req is not met
Chlorine in gas form One (1) ton cylinder	No Bid		
Sulfur Dioxide in gas form (1) ton cylinder	No Bid		
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate Price per (1)gal.	No Bid		
Polyacrylamide based Flocculant Price per 55 gallon drum	\$ 535.50		535.50
Hydrofluoristic Acid Price per (1) gallon	No Bid		
Polyphosphate Calgon C 5 Price per 30 gallon drum	No Bid	1	No Bid

Bid maybe awarded in v

*NOTICE: Bid award is c

Billie Smith (Purchasing