Bid No.-14-03

10/14/2013

Road Materials 11:00 am Central Standard Time R @.W
Bid Tabulation ,
RESPONDERS
Description Unit of Measure TXI Pavers Supply Vulcan Materials Grisham Construction
Hot Mix Price per Ton No Bid $73.29 per Ton No Bid No Bid
Flowable Fill Mixture Price per Cubic Yard $75.00 nMwMMmmwo Fuel No Bid No Bid No Bid
Flexible Base Price per Cubic Yard No Bid $27.24 per Ton No Bid %_wwwwmwﬂwoms ’
Cement Stabilized Flexible Base | Price per Cubic Yard No Bid $45.32 per Ton No Bid No Bid
$19.00 FOB Plant +
Trap Rock Price per Ton No Bid No Bid $49.50 Haul = 68.50 per No Bid
Ton
3/8" Chip Rock Price per Ton No Bid $40.06 per Ton No Bid No Bid
5/8" Chip Rock Price per Ton No Bid $40.06 per Ton No Bid No Bid
Top Soil Price per Cubic Yard Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 per CY
Top Soil Price per Cubic Yard Pick-up No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 per CY
Fill Dirt Price per Cubic Yard Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 per CY
Fill Dirt Price per Cubic Yard Pick-up No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 per CY
Stabilized Sand Price per Cubic Yard Delivered No Bid $51.23 per Ton No Bid No Bid
Stabilized Sand Price per Cubic Yard Pick-up No Bid $43.23 per Ton No Bid No Bid
Concrete Washed Sand Price per Ton Pick-up $21.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concrete Washed Sand Price per Ton Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid may be awarded in whole or by parts

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

.t.%

Billie Smith (Purchasing Manager)




