Bid No 14-08 Date: 11/25/2013 ’
Water and Wastewater Chemicals ‘wﬁs‘%
Bid Tabulation "
Sulfur Liquid
Chlorine - |Dioxide-1| Ammonium Polyacrylamide
Chlorine - 1 1501b ton Sulfate - per | based Flocculant - | Hydrofluorisilicic | Polyphosphate -
Respondor Comments ton cylinder | cylinder | cylinder gallon 55 gallon drum Acid - per gallon | 30 gallon drum

DXI Industries - Dallas, TX No minimum S 584.00 | $ 8750 | S 764.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brenntag Southwest - Dallas, TX 600 gallon minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid S 4.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid
General Chemical Performance - 600 gallon minimum. $1.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5 4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX per gallon for 4,500 truckload

Bid 7.85 per gallon for Poly.
NAPCO Chemical - Spring, TX Converted to 30 gallon drum No Bid No Bid No Bid S 2.50 No Bid S 575§ 235.50

price
American Water Chemical - Plant City, |10 drum minimum. Less than No Bid NG Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 206.16
FL 10 drums $239.96 per drum

1 ini . L h . .
Carus Corporation - Chicago, IL 0 drum minimum. Less than No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 215.82

10 must pay freight.
Shannon Chemical Corp. - Malvern, PA |5 drum minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 224.24
F2 industries - Nashville, TN 10 drum minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 231.08
NALCO Company n- Chicago, IL No Minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ) 807.91 No Bid S 323.00

Clarifloc CE-1473 1 drum
SNF Polydyne - Atlanta, GA minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 504.00 No Bid No 8id
Alantic Coast Polymers - Austin, TX ACP-913. 2 drum minimum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 549.00 No Bid No Bid

4 drum minimum. Less than 4
Southwest Engineers - Tampa, FL drums $625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 573.30 No Bid No Bid

Bid maybe awarded in whole or by parts

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

e

Billie Smith, Purchasing Manager

Carol Reed, Director of Public Works



