Bid No. 16 - 02
Road Materials

Bid Response

October 21, 2015

2:00 pm Central Standard Time

) 3¢

A

Cleveland Asphalt |Ergon Asphalt & Pavers Supply

Description Martin Marietta Products, Inc Emulsions Martin Asphalt Company
CRS-2 Asphalt No Bid $1.7634 $2.1494 $1.8600 No Bid
Hot Mix No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.17
Flowable Fill $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Flexible Base No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.93
Stabilized Flexible No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.10
Trap Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chip Rock 3/8" - Limestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.66
Chip Rock 5/8" - Limestone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.70
Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.17
Concrete Washed Sand $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ready - Mix Concrete - Less five (5) Delivered $105.00 + $30.00 fuel fee |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ready - Mix Concrete - More five (5) delivered $100.00 + $30.00 fuel fee  |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials




