Bid No. 16 - 03

Bid Response

Solid Waste Containers
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November 19, 2015

2:00 pm Central Standard Time

Roll-Offs USA Box Gang Manufacturing | Hedstrom Enviornmental Wastequip Mfg. Co. LLC
Unit/Quantity
Description Initial Order Unit Price | Initial Order | Unit Price | Initial Order | Unit Price | Initial Order Initial Order Unit Price
DUMPSTERS

2 Cubic Yard 4 $378.00 $1,512.00 $412.00 $1,648.00 $480.00 $1,920.00 $354.00 $1,416.00
4 Cubic Yard 4 $493.00 $1,972.00 $541.00 $2,164.00 $655.00 $2,620.00 $481.00 $1,924.00
8 Cubic Yard 8 $706.00 $5,648.00 $804.00 $6,432.00 $1,030.00 $8,240.00 $739.00 $5,912.00

DUMPSTER BOTTOMS

80" X 72" 11 $187.00 $2,057.00 $185.00 $2,035.00 No Bid No Bid $220.00 $2,420.00
78" X 72" 12 $177.00 $2,124.00 $185.00 $2,220.00 No Bid No Bid $218.00 $2,616.00
72" X 72" 7 $170.00 $1,190.00 $175.00 $1,225.00 No Bid No Bid $205.00 $1,435.00

57" X 72" 4 $135.00 $540.00 $160.00 $640.00 No Bid No Bid $176.00 $704.00

36" X 72" 5 $105.00 $525.00 $115.00 $575.00 No Bid No Bid $132.00 $660.00

ROLL-OFFS

20 Cubic Yards 2 $2,747.00 $5,494.00 | $3,425.00 $6,850.00 No Bid No Bid $3,250.00 $6,500.00
30 Cubic Yards 3 $3,057.00 $9,171.00 | $3,650.00 $10,950.00 No Bid No Bid $3,493.00 $10,479.00
40 Cubic Yards 2 $3,892.00 | $7,784.00 | $4,150.00 | $8,300.00 No Bid No Bid $3,984.00 $7,968.00

Freight per truck Estimate 3 Included in Unit
load initial $650.00 $1,950.00 $375.00 $1,125.00 $0.00 Price
Initial PO $39,967.00 $44,164.00 $12,780.00 $42,034.00
*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials
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Carol Reed Director of Public Works
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