
Bid No. 17 - 01

Street Milling with Overlay and Street Reconstruction 2:00 PM Central Standard Time

Bid Tabulation

Description

IMS Condition 

Rating

Unit of 

Measure

Per 

Square 

Yard Total

Per 

Square 

Yard Total

Per 

Square 

Yard Total

Per 

Square 

Yard Total

Per 

Square 

Yard Total

Task / Item# 1

Square 

Yards

Avenue R- 19th to N. End

Very Good to 

Marginal 4,863          $     22.05  $     107,229.15  $     13.95  $    67,838.85  $     14.00  $    68,082.00  $     15.65  $    76,105.95 

Avenue P - 22nd to 25th Fair 5,009          $     22.05  $     110,448.45  $     13.95  $    69,875.55  $     15.00  $    75,135.00  $     15.65  $    78,390.85 

Avenue P (WCIP) - 10th to 7th Marginal 3,840          $     22.05  $       84,672.00  $     13.95  $    53,568.00  $     17.00  $    65,280.00  $     15.65  $    60,096.00 

Avenue I - 7th to 9th Good 2,623          $     22.05  $       57,837.15  $     13.95  $    36,590.85  $     17.00  $    44,591.00  $     15.65  $    41,049.95 

Avenue J - 11th to Bearkat Good to Fair 7,110          $     22.05  $     156,775.50  $     13.95  $    99,184.50  $     16.00  $  113,760.00  $     15.65  $  111,271.50 

Avenue O - 11th to 10th Good 1,487          $     22.05  $       32,788.35  $     13.95  $    20,743.65  $     19.00  $    28,253.00  $     15.65  $    23,271.55 

Camellia Circle - Camellia to End Marginal 756             $     22.05  $       16,669.80  $     13.95  $    10,546.20  $     31.00  $    23,436.00  $     15.65  $    11,831.40 

Camellia Ct. - Camellia to End Very Poor 868             $     22.05  $       19,139.40  $     13.95  $    12,108.60  $     29.00  $    25,172.00  $     15.65  $    13,584.20 

El Toro Dr. - Sam Houston to End Marginal 2,355          $     22.05  $       51,927.75  $     13.95  $    32,852.25  $     17.00  $    40,035.00  $     15.65  $    36,855.75 

W. Hill Park Circle - SH 30 to End Fair 2,902          $     22.05  $       63,989.10  $     13.95  $    40,482.90  $     18.00  $    52,236.00  $     15.65  $    45,416.30 

Holly Springs Dr - Pine Shadows to 

N. End Marginal 2,605          $     22.05  $       57,440.25  $     13.95  $    36,339.75  $     18.00  $    46,890.00  $     15.65  $    40,768.25 

Research Dr. - Medical Ctr Pkwy to 

Memorial Hospital Dr. 

Marginal to 

Poor 2,568          $     22.05  $       56,624.40  $     13.95  $    35,823.60  $     19.00  $    48,792.00  $     15.65  $    40,189.20 

Memorial Hospital Dr. - Robinson 

Creek Pkwy to Medical Center 

Pkwy

Good to 

Marginal 2,259          $     22.05  $       49,810.95  $     13.95  $    31,513.05 18.00$      $    40,662.00  $     15.65  $    35,353.35 

Medical Center PKWY - Research to 

Memorial Hospital Dr. Marginal 2,781          $     22.05  $       61,321.05  $     13.95  $    38,794.95 17.00$      $    47,277.00  $     15.65  $    43,522.65 

13th Street - Ave O to Ave Q Fair 2,309          $     22.05  $       50,913.45  $     13.95  $    32,210.55 18.00$      $    41,562.00  $     15.65  $    36,135.85 

Total Item # 1 44,335      977,586.75$     618,473.25$  761,163.00$  693,842.75$  

Additional UnNamed St. PER SY 22.05$     16.00$     18.00$     15.65$     

Mobilization Fee per St

Bid for all Streets

Task / Item #2

 Linear 

Feet 

Johnson Road

Marginal to 

Poor 6,648         64.60$     429,460.80$     37.88$     251,826.24$  40.85$     271,570.80$  39.00$     259,272.00$  

Alternate HMAC 6,648         66.15$     439,765.20$     35.78$     237,865.44$  42.00$     279,216.00$  

Total Item # 1 & Alt. Item #2 1,417,351.95$  856,338.69$  279,216.00$  761,163.00$  953,114.75$  

No Bid3,500.00$                           750.00$                               

No Bid

Larry Young Paving

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

11/3/2016

Knife River CCC Blacktop Forde ConstructionAAA Asphalt

YES

No Bid

No Bid

NO NO

No Bid

YES

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 

 NO BID 



*NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials




