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Bid No. 17- 01

Stre et Milling with Overlay and Street Reconstruction

11/3/2016

2:00 PM Central Standard Time

Bid Tabulation
Knife River AAA Asphalt CCC Biacktop Forde Construction | Larry Young Paving
Per Per Per Per
IMS Condition| Unitof | Square Square Square Square Square
Description Rating M Yard Total Yard Total Total Yard Total Yard Total
Square
Task/ Item# 1 Yards
Very Good to
Avenue R- 19th to N. End Marginal 4863 |$ 22.05|$ 107,229.15|$ 13.95{ $ 67,838.85 NO BID $ 1400} $ 68,082.00 15.65| $ _76,105.95
Avenue P - 22nd to 25th Fair S5009]|$ 22.05]S5 11044845|5 139516 69,875.55 NOBID $ 1500|$ 75,135.00 15.65| $ 78,390.85
Avenue P {WCIP) - 10th to 7th Marginal 3840 S 2205[$ 8467200|S5 13.95] § 53,568.00 NOBID $ 17.00{$ 65,280.00 15.65! $ 60,096.00
Avenue | - 7th to 9th Good 262316 2205)1$ 57832.1S|$ 13.95{$ 36,590.85 NO BiD $ 12.00{ $ 44,591.00 15.65{ $ 41,049.95
Avenue J - 11th to Bearkat Good to Fair 7,110 [$ 22.05|$ 156,77550|8 1395{$ 99,184.50 NO BID $ 16.00]$ 113,760.00 15.65]$ 111,271.50
Avenue O - 11th to 10th Good 1487 [$ 2205|$ 32,78835|8 13.95{$ 20,743.65 NO BID $ 19.00]| $ 28253.00 15.65] S 23,271.55
Camellia Circle - Camelliato End| Marginal 7561S 2205/$ 166698018 1395/ S5 10,546.20 NO BID $ 31.00]{$ 23,436.00 15.65{ $ 11,831.40
Camellia Ct. - Camellia to End Very Poor 868 1S 22.05{$ 19139.40}$ 1395/ % 1210860 NOBID $ 2900} $ 25172.00 1565| S 13,584.20
El Toro Dr. - Sam Houston tc End{  Marginal 235515 22055 S1,927.75|$ 1395|$ 3285225 NO BID $ 17.00{ § 40,035.00 15.65| $ 36,855.75
W, Hill Park Circle - SH30to End Fair 290218 2205]8 63989.10|$ 1395 S 40482.90 NO BID $ 1800{S 52,236.00 15.65| $ 45,416.30
Holly Springs Dr - Pine Shadows
toN. End Marginal 2,605 2205|$ 57,440.28 13.95]1 $ 36,339.75 NO BID $ 18,00| $ 46,890.00 15.65]| $ 40,768.25
Research Dr. - Medical Ctr Pkwy | Marginal to
to Memorial Hospital Or. Poor 2,568 2205|$  56,624.40 13.95| $ 35,823.60 NOBID $ 19.00|$ 48,792.00 15.65] S 40,189.20
Memorial Hospital Dr. -
Robinson Creek Pkwy to Good to
Medical Center Pkwy Marginal 2,259 2205] S 49,810.95 13951 $ 31513.05 NOBID $ 18.00 | $ 40,662.00 15.65/$ 35,353.35
Medical Center PKWY -
Research to Memorial Hospital )
Dr. Marginal 2,781 2205|$ 6132105 13.95| $ 38,794.95 NOBID $ 17.00]5 47,277.00 1565} § 43,522.65
13th Street- Ave Oto Ave Q Fair 2,309 2205]$ 5091345 13.95] $ 32,210.55 NOBID $ 18.00 | $ 41,562.00 15.65| $ 36,135.85
Total item # 1 44,335 $ 977,586.75 $618,473.25 $761,163.00 $693,842.75
Additional UnNamed St. PER SY 22.05 16.00 NOBID $ 18.00 15.65
Mabilization Fee per St No Bid 3,500.00 NOBID No Bid 750.00
Bid for all Streets YES NO NOBID YES NO
Linear
Task / Item #2 feet
Marginal to
Johnson Road Poor 6,648 64.60 | $ 429,460.80 37.88 | $251,826.24 | $ 40.85 | $271,570.80 No Bid 39.00 | $259,272.00
Alternate HMAC 6,648 66.15 | $ 439,765.20 35.78 | $237,865.44 | $ 42.00 | $279,216.00 No Bid No Bid
Total item # 1 & Alt, item #2 $1,417,351.95 $856,338.69 $279,216.00 $761,163.00 $953,114.75

*NOTICE: 8id award Is contingent upon vendor meeting bid requirements and formal authorization by City officials

[ ]
sjeaosddy

pa198png si wR)| X

(53502 saoeds Buyued
suoliesyjdu| |eidueuly

[euoippe 1o} PIAOW 000‘0STS 7B [IBJOYS 3nUA3L Bupjied pled 10 000'EYTS PadNpal) LI8'YST'TS 01

UOIIEWLIOJU| PIIRIDOSSY

mo|3q uone|nges pig

Asusony Aud

TSOES-€CE-TOT

adueuld JO IO

Jagdeue\ AR

papuawe /T8'Lyy TS 198png jeuidio Jo Junowe ays uj



